

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Art-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

AWARD Highlighted in Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

Standard Stationary

% for Non-resident Illinois, none, must reference Bid# 58838

ESD Item	IMESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
MISCELLANEOUS ART								
30-002	Watercolor Paints, Studio Tray Set, 8 color, Snap Shut, w/Brush Prang 80525 or Approved Equal	200	Set	\$ 1.12	set	\$ 224.00	Prang	
30-004	Oil Pastels, 12-Colors/Set, Pentel PHN-	250	Set	\$ 0.48	set	\$ 120.00	Hopemate	
				\$ 3.00	set	\$ 750.00	Dixon Sketcho	Alternate
						\$ 344.00		
PLASTIC MODELING CLAY								
1 Lb. Pkg., Oil Base, Dixon Prang #200 or Approved Equal								
30-020	Blue	0	Pkg	\$ 0.81	Pkg	\$ -	Happy Stix	All or none Category
30-021	Brown	40	Pkg	\$ 0.81	Pkg	\$ 32.40	Happy Stix	
30-022	Cream	38	Pkg	\$ 0.81	Pkg	\$ 30.78	Happy Stix	
30-023	Gray	40	Pkg	\$ 0.81	Pkg	\$ 32.40	Happy Stix	
30-024	Green	0	Pkg	\$ 0.81	Pkg	\$ -	Happy Stix	
30-025	Red	0	Pkg	\$ 0.81	Pkg	\$ -	Happy Stix	
30-026	Yellow	20	Pkg	\$ 0.81	Pkg	\$ 16.20	Happy Stix	
30-027	Assorted Colors	48	Pkg	\$ 0.81	Pkg	\$ 38.88	Happy Stix	
	subtotal=	31	Ctn			\$ 150.66		
30-029	Model Magic Clay, White, 2 lb/Bucket, 2 Bkts/Ctn, BIN57440 or	10	Ctn			No Bid		
30-030	Colored Pencil, W/O Erasers 12/Set, Prang 20270 or Approved Equal	700	Set	\$ 0.98	Ctn	\$ 682.50	Prang	
WAX CRAYONS								
3 5/8 x 5/16, (Wrapped), Label Shall State Color, Prang or Approved Equal								
30-035	8 Colors/Box, 12 Boxes/Carton	23	Ctn	\$ 2.57	Ctn	\$ 59.11	Prang	All or none Category
30-036	16 Colors/Box, 12 Boxes/Carton	70	Ctn	\$ 4.80	Ctn	\$ 336.00	Prang	
						\$ 395.11		
30-046	Rubber Cement, 4 Oz. Jar, 12/Carton, Elmer's or Approved Equal	45	Ctn	\$ 10.26	Ctn	\$ 461.70	Elmers	
WHITE GLUE								
Elmer's Glue-All or Approved								
30-060	1 1/2 Oz. Squeeze Bottle, 12/Carton	10	Ctn	\$ 7.34	Ctn	\$ 73.40	Elmers	All or none Category
30-061	4 Oz. Squeeze Bottle, 12/Carton	50	Ctn	\$ 7.74	Ctn	\$ 387.00	Elmers	
30-062	8 Oz. Squeeze Bottle, 12/Carton	30	Ctn	\$ 12.22	Ctn	\$ 366.60	Elmers	
30-067	Gallon, Plastic Jar, 2 Gal/Carton	10	Ctn	\$ 13.63	Ctn	\$ 136.30	Elmers	
						\$ 1,425.00		
GLUESTICKS								
30-074	Glue Sticks, Solid, 0.28 Oz. 12/Pkg 888 Pkg, Note: District will accept packages of 12 ct only, CLI #94028 or Approved Equal	400	Pkg	\$ 1.14	Pkg	\$ 456.00	Wellgo	
GLITTER								
1lb, Shaker								
30-085	Blue, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	18	Ea	\$ 2.96	Ea	\$ 53.28	Sparkles	All or none Category
30-086	Gold, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	24	Ea	\$ 2.96	Ea	\$ 71.04	Sparkles	
30-087	Green, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$ 2.96	Ea	\$ -	Sparkles	

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Art-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

AWARD Highlighted In Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

Standard Stationary

% for Non-resident Illinois, none, must reference Bid# 58838

ESD Item #	IMESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
30-088	Red, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$ 2.96	Ea	\$ -	Sparkles	
30-089	Silver, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	30	Ea	\$ 2.96	Ea	\$ 88.80	Sparkles	
subtotal=		3	cartons			\$ 213.12		
TEMPERA PAINT								All or none Category
first Quality, 16 oz. Liquid, 12/Case Bestemp, Prang, Sargent Art or Approved Equal								
30-159	Red	15	Cs	\$ 12.29	Cs	\$ 184.35	Prang	
30-160	Orange	2	Cs	\$ 12.29	Cs	\$ 24.58	Prang	
30-161	Yellow	20	Cs	\$ 12.29	Cs	\$ 245.80	Prang	
30-162	Green	15	Cs	\$ 12.29	Cs	\$ 184.35	Prang	
30-163	Blue	18	Cs	\$ 12.29	Cs	\$ 221.22	Prang	
30-164	Violet	2	Cs	\$ 12.29	Cs	\$ 24.58	Prang	
30-165	Magenta	15	Cs	\$ 12.29	Cs	\$ 184.35	Prang	
30-166	Brown	3	Cs	\$ 12.29	Cs	\$ 36.87	Prang	
30-167	Black	15	Cs	\$ 12.29	Cs	\$ 184.35	Prang	
30-168	White	30	Cs	\$ 12.29	Cs	\$ 368.70	Prang	
subtotal=		2	pallets			\$ 1,659.15		
BUTCHER PAPER								All or none Category
Non-Coated Heavy 50#, 36" x 1000' length ROLL, Min. Brightness: 75, Opacity: 75, Smooth Finish, Individually Wrapped, Dual Finish or Approved Equal								
30-469	White	50	Roll	\$ 35.25	Roll	\$ 1,762.50	Pacon	
30-470	Brown	15	Roll	\$ 35.93	Roll	\$ 538.95	Pacon	
30-471	Holiday Red/Flame Red	15	Roll	\$ 45.20	Roll	\$ 678.00	Pacon	
30-472	Scarlet	0	Roll	\$ 38.97	Roll	\$ -	Pacon	
30-473	Canary Yellow	15	Roll	\$ 43.14	Roll	\$ 647.10	Pacon	
30-474	Autumn Gold	2	Roll	\$ 43.62	Roll	\$ 87.24	Pacon	
30-475	Orange	10	Roll	\$ 43.14	Roll	\$ 431.40	Pacon	
30-476	Light Green	0	Roll	\$ 43.73	Roll	\$ -	Pacon	
30-477	Brite Green	8	Roll	\$ 48.81	Roll	\$ 390.48	Pacon	
30-478	Emerald Green	10	Roll	\$ 34.17	Roll	\$ 341.70	Pacon	
30-479	Light/Sky Blue	10	Roll	\$ 42.56	Roll	\$ 425.60	Pacon	
30-480	Brite Blue	12	Roll	\$ 45.55	Roll	\$ 546.60	Pacon	
30-481	Dark Blue	7	Roll	\$ 36.86	Roll	\$ 258.02	Pacon	
30-482	Pink	8	Roll	\$ 41.82	Roll	\$ 334.56	Pacon	
30-483	Black	30	Roll	\$ 39.86	Roll	\$ 1,195.80	Pacon	
30-484	Purple	8	Roll	\$ 42.56	Roll	\$ 340.48	Pacon	
subtotal=		5	pallets			\$ 7,978.43		
RAILROAD BOARD								All or none Category
4 PLY, 22" x 28", 100 Sheets/Pkg., Grain Long, (Each package								
30-540	Black	10	Pkg	\$ 17.87	Pkg	\$ 178.70	Pacon	
30-541	Royal Blue	0	Pkg	\$ 20.50	Pkg	\$ -	Pacon	
30-542	Azure	6	Pkg	\$ 17.81	Pkg	\$ 106.86	Pacon	
30-544	Canary	0	Pkg	\$ -	Pkg	\$ -	Pacon	
30-548	Kelly Green	0	Pkg	\$ 20.50	Pkg	\$ -	Pacon	
30-549	Emerald Green	12	Pkg	\$ 17.81	Pkg	\$ 213.72	Pacon	
30-550	Red	5	Pkg	\$ 17.81	Pkg	\$ 89.05	Pacon	
30-551	Orange	0	Pkg	\$ 20.50	Pkg	\$ -	Pacon	
30-552	Lemon Yellow	0	Pkg	\$ 20.50	Pkg	\$ -	Pacon	
30-553	White	0	Pkg	\$ 16.42	Pkg	\$ -	Pacon	
30-554	Purple	0	Pkg	\$ 20.50	Pkg	\$ -	Pacon	

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Art-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

AWARD Highlighted In Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

Standard Stationary

% for Non-resident Illinois, none, must reference Bid# 58838

ESD Item I	MESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes	
30-556	Buff	6	Pkg		Pkg	\$ -	Pacon		
						\$ 588.33			
<p><u>6 PLY, 22" X 28", 50 Sheets/Pkg., Grain Long, (Each package</u></p>									
30-558	Black	10	Pkg	\$ 25.17	Pkg	\$ 251.70	Pacon		
30-559	Royal Blue	6	Pkg	\$ 25.17	Pkg	\$ 151.02	Pacon		
30-560	Azure	6	Pkg	\$ 25.17	Pkg	\$ 151.02	Pacon		
30-561	Ginger/Brown	0	Pkg	\$ 25.17	Pkg	\$ -	Pacon		
30-562	Canary	10	Pkg	\$ 25.17	Pkg	\$ 251.70	Pacon		
30-565	Kelly Green	8	Pkg	\$ 25.17	Pkg	\$ 201.36	Pacon	100 Sht/Pk 1 Pk/CS	
30-566	Emerald Green	0	Pkg	\$ 25.17	Pkg	\$ -	Pacon		
30-567	Red	10	Pkg	\$ 25.17	Pkg	\$ 251.70	Pacon		
30-569	Lemon Yellow	0	Pkg	\$ 25.17	Pkg	\$ -	Pacon		
30-570	White	0	Pkg	\$ 25.17	Pkg	\$ -	Pacon		
						\$ 1,258.50			
TAGBOARD								All or none Category	
<p><u>Manila, 150# Stock, 100 Sheets/Pkg., Each package Individually Shrink-Wrapped; Product shall be delivered</u></p>									
30-530	9 x 12 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg	\$ 2.19	Pkg	\$ -	Pacon	12/Cs	
30-531	12 x 18 Stock, 100shts/pkg	3	Pkg	\$ 4.11	Pkg	\$ 12.33	Pacon	6/Cs	
30-532	18 x 24 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg	\$ 9.01	Pkg	\$ -	Pacon	1/Cs	
30-533	24 x 36 Stock, 100shts/pkg	6	Pkg	\$ 17.45	Pkg	\$ 104.70	Pacon	1/Cs	
<p><u>White, 150# Stock, 100 Sheets/Pkg</u></p>									
30-534	9 x 12 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg	\$ 2.19	Pkg	\$ -	Pacon	12/Cs	
30-535	12 x 18 Stock, 100shts/pkg	11	Pkg	\$ 4.32	Pkg	\$ 47.52	Pacon	6/Cs	
30-536	18 x 24 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg	\$ 9.01	Pkg	\$ -	Pacon	1/Cs	
30-537	24 x 36 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg	\$ 17.45	Pkg	\$ -	Pacon	1/Cs	
<p><u>Chart-Ruled Tagboard, 24"x36", Nifty</u></p>									
30-572	24 x 36 Stock, 100 shts/pkg	0	Pkg	\$ 14.08	Pkg	\$ -			
						\$ 164.55			
CONSTRUCTION PAPER								All or none Category	
<p>100% Sulfite pulp, individually film wrapped PACON TRU-RAY or Approved Equal</p>									
<p><u>9" X 12" Inch, 76 Lb., 50 Sheets/Pkg.,</u></p>									
31-282	Spring/Light Green	0	Cs	\$ 57.31	Cs	\$ -	Pacon/TruRay		
31-283	Festive/Holiday Green	8	Cs	\$ 58.31	Cs	\$ 466.48	Pacon/TruRay		
31-284	Dark Green	0	Cs	\$ 56.77	Cs	\$ -	Pacon/TruRay		
31-285	Brilliant/Hot Lime	15	Cs	\$ 60.35	Cs	\$ 905.25	Pacon/TruRay		
31-286	Light Yellow	2	Cs	\$ 53.05	Cs	\$ 106.10	Pacon/TruRay		
31-287	Yellow	14	Cs	\$ 54.18	Cs	\$ 758.52	Pacon/TruRay		
31-289	Pumpkin	0	Cs	\$ 54.78	Cs	\$ -	Pacon/TruRay		
31-290	Orange	13	Cs	\$ 55.27	Cs	\$ 718.51	Pacon/TruRay		
31-291	Gold	0	Cs	\$ 53.68	Cs	\$ -	Pacon/TruRay		
31-292	Red	0	Cs	\$ 53.68	Cs	\$ -	Pacon/TruRay		
31-294	Festive/Holiday Red	5	Cs	\$ 55.27	Cs	\$ 276.35	Pacon/TruRay		
31-296	Shocking/Hot Pink	12	Cs	\$ 56.27	Cs	\$ 675.24	Pacon/TruRay		
31-298	Pink	15	Cs	\$ 55.77	Cs	\$ 836.55	Pacon/TruRay		
31-299	Magenta	6	Cs	\$ 59.30	Cs	\$ 355.80	Pacon/TruRay		
31-300	Lilac	12	Cs	\$ 51.64	Cs	\$ 619.68	Pacon/TruRay		
31-301	Violet	0	Cs	\$ 54.18	Cs	\$ -	Pacon/TruRay		
31-302	Purple	6	Cs	\$ 57.31	Cs	\$ 343.86	Pacon/TruRay		
31-303	Royal Blue	0	Cs	\$ 57.31	Cs	\$ -	Pacon/TruRay		
31-304	Blue	8	Cs	\$ 57.31	Cs	\$ 458.48	Pacon/TruRay		

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Art-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

AWARD Highlighted in Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

Standard Stationary

% for Non-resident Illinois, none, must reference Bid# 58838

ESD Item	IMESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
31-305	Turquoise	0	Cs	\$ 59.30	Cs	\$ -	Pacon/TruRay	
31-306	Sky Blue	15	Cs	\$ 51.64	Cs	\$ 774.60	Pacon/TruRay	
31-307	White	40	Cs	\$ 47.44	Cs	\$ 1,897.60	Pacon/TruRay	
31-308	Salmon	0	Cs	\$ 47.56	Cs	\$ -	Pacon/TruRay	
31-310	Warm Brown	6	Cs	\$ 60.35	Cs	\$ 362.10	Pacon/TruRay	
31-311	Dark Brown	8	Cs	\$ 54.18	Cs	\$ 433.44	Pacon/TruRay	
31-312	Gray	0	Cs	\$ 53.18	Cs	\$ -	Pacon/TruRay	
31-314	Black	15	Cs	\$ 48.61	Cs	\$ 729.15	Pacon/TruRay	
31-500	Assorted Colors	0	Cs	\$ 60.89	Cs	\$ -	Pacon/TruRay	
subtotal=		5	pallets			\$ 10,717.71		
12 x 18 Inch, 76 Lb., 50 Sheets/Pkg., 25 pkgs/case								
31-318	Festive/Holiday Green	20	Cs	\$ 56.27		\$ 1,125.40		
31-319	Dark Green	3	Cs	\$ 54.48		\$ 163.44		
31-320	Brilliant/Hot Lime	6	Cs	\$ 57.81		\$ 346.86		
31-321	Light Yellow	3	Cs	\$ 50.40		\$ 151.20		
31-322	Yellow	5	Cs	\$ 52.17		\$ 260.85		
31-325	Orange	15	Cs	\$ 52.96		\$ 794.40		
31-324	Pumpkin	4	Cs	\$ 52.17		\$ 208.68		
31-326	Gold	2	Cs	\$ 51.14		\$ 102.28		
31-327	Red	0	Cs	\$ 51.14		\$ -		
31-329	Festive/Holiday Red	12	Cs	\$ 52.69		\$ 632.28		
31-331	Shocking/Hot Pink	3	Cs	\$ 53.98		\$ 161.94		
31-333	Pink	3	Cs	\$ 53.46		\$ 160.38		
31-334	Magenta	2	Cs	\$ 56.90		\$ 113.80		
31-335	Lilac	8	Cs	\$ 49.88		\$ 399.04		
31-336	Violet	0	Cs	\$ 52.17		\$ -		
31-337	Purple	4	Cs	\$ 54.73		\$ 218.92		
31-338	Royal Blue	0	Cs	\$ 55.25		\$ -		
31-339	Blue	5	Cs	\$ 55.25		\$ 276.25		
31-340	Turquoise	8	Cs	\$ 57.29		\$ 458.32		
31-341	Sky Blue	8	Cs	\$ 49.88		\$ 399.04		
31-342	White	80	Cs	\$ 45.16		\$ 3,612.80		
31-343	Salmon	0	Cs	\$ 57.81		\$ -		
31-345	Warm Brown	10	Cs	\$ 48.86		\$ 488.60		
31-346	Dark Brown	3	Cs	\$ 51.92		\$ 155.76		
31-347	Gray	0	Cs	\$ 50.40		\$ -		
31-349	Black	32	Cs	\$ 46.27		\$ 1,480.64		
31-501	Assorted Colors	4	Cs	\$ 59.85		\$ 239.40		
subtotal=		6	pallets			\$ 11,950.28		

Pricing Firm Until: 6/5/2015

Delivery Date: 7-10 Days ARO

Terms: Net 30 Days

Minimum Order	Vendor
\$ 700.00	Elmers
\$ 500.00	Prang
\$ 500.00	Dixon
\$ 3,000.00	Pacon

AWARD Highlighted In Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

Blick Art Materials

% for Non-resident Illinois, none, must reference Bid#QBM2360

ESD Item	ESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
MISCELLANEOUS ART								
30-002	Watercolor Paints, Studio Tray Set, 8 color, Snap Shut, w/Brush Prang 80525 or Approved Equal	200	Set		set	\$ -		
30-004	Oil Pastels, 12-Colors/Set, Pentel PHN-	250	Set		set	\$ -		
					set	\$ -		
						\$ -		
PLASTIC MODELING CLAY								
1 Lb. Pkg., Oil Base, Dixon Prang #200 or Approved Equal								
30-020	Blue	0	Pkg			\$ -		All or none Category
30-021	Brown	40	Pkg			\$ -		
30-022	Cream	38	Pkg			\$ -		
30-023	Gray	40	Pkg			\$ -		
30-024	Green	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-025	Red	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-026	Yellow	20	Pkg			\$ -		
30-027	Assorted Colors	48	Pkg			\$ -		
	subtotal=	31	Ctn			\$ -		
30-029	Model Magic Clay, White, 2 lb/Bucket, 2 Bkts/Ctn, BIN57440 or	10	Ctn			\$ -		
30-030	Colored Pencil, W/O Erasers 12/Set, Prang 20270 or Approved Equal	700	Set			\$ -		
WAX CRAYONS								
3 5/8 x 5/16, (Wrapped), Label Shall State Color, Prang or Approved Equal								
30-035	8 Colors/Box, 12 Boxes/Carton	23	Ctn			\$ -		All or none Category
30-036	16 Colors/Box, 12 Boxes/Carton	70	Ctn			\$ -		
						\$ -		
30-046	Rubber Cement, 4 Oz. Jar, 12/Carton, Elmer's or Approved Equal	45	Ctn			\$ -		
WHITE GLUE								
Elmer's Glue-All or Approved								
30-060	1 1/4 Oz. Squeeze Bottle, 12/Carton	10	Ctn			\$ -		All or none Category
30-061	4 Oz. Squeeze Bottle, 12/Carton	50	Ctn			\$ -		
30-062	8 Oz. Squeeze Bottle, 12/Carton	30	Ctn			\$ -		
30-067	Gallon, Plastic Jar, 2 Gal/Carton	10	Ctn			\$ -		
						\$ -		
GLUESTICKS								
30-074	Glue Sticks, Solid, 0.28 Oz. 12/Pkg 888 Pkg, Note: District will accept packages of 12 ct only, CLI #94028 or Approved Equal	400	Pkg			\$ -		
GLITTER								
1lb, Shaker								
30-085	Blue, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	18	Ea			\$ -		All or none Category
30-086	Gold, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	24	Ea			\$ -		
30-087	Green, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	0	Ea			\$ -		

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Art-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:

AWARD Highlighted In Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

Blick Art Materials

% for Non-resident Illinois, none, must reference Bid#QBM2360

ESD Item	IMESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
30-088	Red, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	0	Ea			\$ -		
30-089	Silver, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	30	Ea			\$ -		
subtotal=		3	cartons			\$ -		
TEMPERA PAINT								All or none Category
first Quality, 16 oz. Liquid, 12/Case Bestemp, Prang, Sargent Art or Approved Equal								
30-159	Red	15	Cs	\$ 19.92	Cs	\$ 298.80	Blick Essentials	
30-160	Orange	2	Cs	\$ 19.92	Cs	\$ 39.84	Blick Essentials	
30-161	Yellow	20	Cs	\$ 19.92	Cs	\$ 398.40	Blick Essentials	
30-162	Green	15	Cs	\$ 19.92	Cs	\$ 298.80	Blick Essentials	
30-163	Blue	18	Cs	\$ 19.92	Cs	\$ 358.56	Blick Essentials	
30-164	Violet	2	Cs	\$ 19.92	Cs	\$ 39.84	Blick Essentials	
30-165	Magenta	15	Cs	\$ 19.92	Cs	\$ 298.80	Blick Essentials	
30-166	Brown	3	Cs	\$ 19.92	Cs	\$ 59.76	Blick Essentials	
30-167	Black	15	Cs	\$ 19.92	Cs	\$ 298.80	Blick Essentials	
30-168	White	30	Cs	\$ 19.92	Cs	\$ 597.60	Blick Essentials	
subtotal=		2	pallets			\$ 2,689.20		
BUTCHER PAPER								All or none Category
Non-Coated Heavy 50#, 36" x 1000' length ROLL, Min. Brightness: 75, Opacity: 75, Smooth Finish, Individually Wrapped, Dual Finish or Approved Equal								
30-469	White	50	Roll			\$ -		
30-470	Brown	15	Roll			\$ -		
30-471	Holiday Red/Flame Red	15	Roll			\$ -		
30-472	Scarlet	0	Roll			\$ -		
30-473	Canary Yellow	15	Roll			\$ -		
30-474	Autumn Gold	2	Roll			\$ -		
30-475	Orange	10	Roll			\$ -		
30-476	Light Green	0	Roll			\$ -		
30-477	Brite Green	8	Roll			\$ -		
30-478	Emerald Green	10	Roll			\$ -		
30-479	Light/Sky Blue	10	Roll			\$ -		
30-480	Brite Blue	12	Roll			\$ -		
30-481	Dark Blue	7	Roll			\$ -		
30-482	Pink	8	Roll			\$ -		
30-483	Black	30	Roll			\$ -		
30-484	Purple	8	Roll			\$ -		
subtotal=		5	pallets			\$ -		
RAILROAD BOARD								All or none Category
4 PLY, 22" x 28", 100 Sheets/Pkg., Grain Long, (Each package								
30-540	Black	10	Pkg			\$ -		
30-541	Royal Blue	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-542	Azure	6	Pkg			\$ -		
30-544	Canary	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-548	Kelly Green	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-549	Emerald Green	12	Pkg			\$ -		
30-550	Red	5	Pkg			\$ -		
30-551	Orange	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-552	Lemon Yellow	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-553	White	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-554	Purple	0	Pkg			\$ -		

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Art-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:

AWARD Highlighted In Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

Blick Art Materials

% for Non-resident Illinois, none, must reference Bid#QBM2360

ESD Item	IMESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
30-556	Buff	6	Pkg			\$ -		
						\$ -		
	<u>6 PLY, 22" X 28", 50 Sheets/Pkg.,</u> Grain Long, (Each package							
30-558	Black	10	Pkg			\$ -		
30-559	Royal Blue	6	Pkg			\$ -		
30-560	Azure	6	Pkg			\$ -		
30-561	Ginger/Brown	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-562	Canary	10	Pkg			\$ -		
30-565	Kelly Green	8	Pkg			\$ -		
30-566	Emerald Green	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-567	Red	10	Pkg			\$ -		
30-569	Lemon Yellow	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-570	White	0	Pkg			\$ -		
						\$ -		
TAGBOARD								All or none Category
	<u>Manila, 150# Stock, 100 Sheets/Pkg.,</u> Each package Individually Shrink- Wrapped; <i>Product shall be delivered</i>							
30-530	9 x 12 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-531	12 x 18 Stock, 100shts/pkg	3	Pkg			\$ -		
30-532	18 x 24 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-533	24 x 36 Stock, 100shts/pkg	6	Pkg			\$ -		
	<u>White, 150# Stock, 100 Sheets/Pkg</u>							
30-534	9 x 12 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-535	12 x 18 Stock, 100shts/pkg	11	Pkg			\$ -		
30-536	18 x 24 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-537	24 x 36 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
	<u>Chart-Ruled Tagboard, 24"x36", Nifty</u>							
30-572	24 x 36 Stock, 100 shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
						\$ -		
CONSTRUCTION PAPER								All or none Category
	100% Sulfite pulp, individually film wrapped PACON TRU-RAY or Approved Equal <u>9" X 12" Inch, 76 Lb., 50 Sheets/Pkg.,</u>							
31-282	Spring/Light Green	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-283	Festive/Holiday Green	8	Cs			\$ -		
31-284	Dark Green	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-285	Brilliant/Hot Lime	15	Cs			\$ -		
31-286	Light Yellow	2	Cs			\$ -		
31-287	Yellow	14	Cs			\$ -		
31-289	Pumpkin	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-290	Orange	13	Cs			\$ -		
31-291	Gold	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-292	Red	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-294	Festive/Holiday Red	5	Cs			\$ -		
31-296	Shocking/Hot Pink	12	Cs			\$ -		
31-298	Pink	15	Cs			\$ -		
31-299	Magenta	6	Cs			\$ -		
31-300	Lilac	12	Cs			\$ -		
31-301	Violet	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-302	Purple	6	Cs			\$ -		
31-303	Royal Blue	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-304	Blue	8	Cs			\$ -		

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Art-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:

AWARD Highlighted In Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

Blick Art Materials

% for Non-resident Illinois, none, must reference Bid#QBM2360

ESD Item	IMESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
31-305	Turquoise	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-306	Sky Blue	15	Cs			\$ -		
31-307	White	40	Cs			\$ -		
31-308	Salmon	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-310	Warm Brown	6	Cs			\$ -		
31-311	Dark Brown	8	Cs			\$ -		
31-312	Gray	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-314	Black	15	Cs			\$ -		
31-500	Assorted Colors	0	Cs			\$ -		
subtotal=		5	pallets			\$ -		
12 x 18 Inch, 76 Lb., 50 Sheets/Pkg., 25 pks/case								
31-318	Festive/Holiday Green	20	Cs			\$ -		
31-319	Dark Green	3	Cs			\$ -		
31-320	Brilliant/Hot Lime	6	Cs			\$ -		
31-321	Light Yellow	3	Cs			\$ -		
31-322	Yellow	5	Cs			\$ -		
31-325	Orange	15	Cs			\$ -		
31-324	Pumpkin	4	Cs			\$ -		
31-326	Gold	2	Cs			\$ -		
31-327	Red	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-329	Festive/Holiday Red	12	Cs			\$ -		
31-331	Shocking/Hot Pink	3	Cs			\$ -		
31-333	Pink	3	Cs			\$ -		
31-334	Magenta	2	Cs			\$ -		
31-335	Lilac	8	Cs			\$ -		
31-336	Violet	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-337	Purple	4	Cs			\$ -		
31-338	Royal Blue	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-339	Blue	5	Cs			\$ -		
31-340	Turquoise	8	Cs			\$ -		
31-341	Sky Blue	8	Cs			\$ -		
31-342	White	80	Cs			\$ -		
31-343	Salmon	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-345	Warm Brown	10	Cs			\$ -		
31-346	Dark Brown	3	Cs			\$ -		
31-347	Gray	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-349	Black	32	Cs			\$ -		
31-501	Assorted Colors	4	Cs			\$ -		
subtotal=		6	pallets			\$ -		

Pricing Firm Until: 12/31/2014
Delivery Date: 7-28 days ARO
Terms: Net 30 days

Minimum Order **Vendor**
 na na

AWARD Highlighted In Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

Discount School Supply

% for Non-resident California, none, must reference Bid# IMESD4

ESD Item	IMESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
MISCELLANEOUS ART								
30-002	Watercolor Paints, Studio Tray Set, 8 color, Snap Shut, w/Brush Prang 80525 or Approved Equal	200	Set		set	\$ 3.19		
30-004	Oil Pastels, 12-Colors/Set, Pentel PHN-	250	Set		set	\$ -		
					set	\$ -		
						\$ 3.19		
PLASTIC MODELING CLAY								
1 Lb. Pkg., Oil Base, Dixon Prang #200 or Approved Equal								
30-020	Blue	0	Pkg			\$ -		All or none Category
30-021	Brown	40	Pkg			\$ -		
30-022	Cream	38	Pkg			\$ -		
30-023	Gray	40	Pkg			\$ -		
30-024	Green	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-025	Red	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-026	Yellow	20	Pkg			\$ -		
30-027	Assorted Colors	48	Pkg			\$ -		
	subtotal=	31	Ctn			\$ -		
30-029	Model Magic Clay, White, 2 lb/Bucket, 2 Bkts/Ctn, BIN57440 or	10	Ctn			\$ 17.09	Crayola	
30-030	Colored Pencil, W/O Erasers 12/Set, Prang 20270 or Approved Equal	700	Set			\$ 1.99	Crayola	
WAX CRAYONS								
3 5/8 x 5/16, (Wrapped), Label Shall State Color, Prang or Approved Equal								
30-035	8 Colors/Box, 12 Boxes/Carton	23	Ctn			\$ 0.42	Crayola	All or none Category
30-036	16 Colors/Box, 12 Boxes/Carton	70	Ctn			\$ 0.64	Crayola	
						\$ 1.06		
30-046	Rubber Cement, 4 Oz. Jar, 12/Carton, Elmer's or Approved Equal	45	Ctn			\$ -		
WHITE GLUE								
Elmer's Glue-All or Approved								
30-060	1 1/4 Oz. Squeeze Bottle, 12/Carton	10	Ctn			\$ -		All or none Category
30-061	4 Oz. Squeeze Bottle, 12/Carton	50	Ctn			\$ -		
30-062	8 Oz. Squeeze Bottle, 12/Carton	30	Ctn			\$ -		
30-067	Gallon, Plastic Jar, 2 Gal/Carton	10	Ctn			\$ -		
						\$ -		
GLUESTICKS								
30-074	Glue Sticks, Solid, 0.28 Oz. 12/Pkg 888 Pkg, Note: District will accept packages of 12 ct only, CLI #94028 or Approved Equal	400	Pkg			\$ 2.81	Colorations	
GLITTER								
1lb, Shaker								
30-085	Blue, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	18	Ea			\$ 5.24	Colorations	All or none Category
30-086	Gold, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	24	Ea			\$ 5.24	Colorations	
30-087	Green, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	0	Ea			\$ 5.24	Colorations	

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Art-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:

AWARD Highlighted In Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

Discount School Supply

% for Non-resident California, none, must reference Bid# IMESD4

ESD Item	IMESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
30-088	Red, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	0	Ea			\$ 5.24	Colorations	
30-089	Silver, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	30	Ea			\$ 5.24	Colorations	
subtotal=		3	cartons			\$ 26.20		

TEMPERA PAINT

All or none Category

first Quality, 16 oz. Liquid,
12/Case Bestemp, Prang, Sargent
Art or Approved Equal

30-159	Red	15	Cs			\$ 1.49	Colorations	
30-160	Orange	2	Cs			\$ 1.49	Colorations	
30-161	Yellow	20	Cs			\$ 1.49	Colorations	
30-162	Green	15	Cs			\$ 1.49	Colorations	
30-163	Blue	18	Cs			\$ 1.49	Colorations	
30-164	Violet	2	Cs			\$ 1.49	Colorations	
30-165	Magenta	15	Cs			\$ 1.49	Colorations	
30-166	Brown	3	Cs			\$ 1.49	Colorations	
30-167	Black	15	Cs			\$ 1.49	Colorations	
30-168	White	30	Cs			\$ 1.49	Colorations	
subtotal=		2	pallets			\$ 14.90		

BUTCHER PAPER

All or none Category

Non-Coated Heavy 50#, 36" x 1000'
length ROLL, Min. Brightness: 75,
Opacity: 75, Smooth Finish,
Individually Wrapped, Dual Finish or
Approved Equal

30-469	White	50	Roll			\$ -		
30-470	Brown	15	Roll			\$ -		
30-471	Holiday Red/Flame Red	15	Roll			\$ -		
30-472	Scarlet	0	Roll			\$ -		
30-473	Canary Yellow	15	Roll			\$ -		
30-474	Autumn Gold	2	Roll			\$ -		
30-475	Orange	10	Roll			\$ -		
30-476	Light Green	0	Roll			\$ -		
30-477	Brite Green	8	Roll			\$ -		
30-478	Emerald Green	10	Roll			\$ -		
30-479	Light/Sky Blue	10	Roll			\$ -		
30-480	Brite Blue	12	Roll			\$ -		
30-481	Dark Blue	7	Roll			\$ -		
30-482	Pink	8	Roll			\$ -		
30-483	Black	30	Roll			\$ -		
30-484	Purple	8	Roll			\$ -		
subtotal=		5	pallets			\$ -		

RAILROAD BOARD

All or none Category

4 PLY, 22" x 28", 100 Sheets/Pkg.,
Grain Long, (Each package

30-540	Black	10	Pkg			\$ -		
30-541	Royal Blue	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-542	Azure	6	Pkg			\$ -		
30-544	Canary	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-548	Kelly Green	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-549	Emerald Green	12	Pkg			\$ -		
30-550	Red	5	Pkg			\$ -		
30-551	Orange	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-552	Lemon Yellow	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-553	White	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-554	Purple	0	Pkg			\$ -		

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Art-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:

AWARD Highlighted In Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

Discount School Supply

% for Non-resident California, none, must reference Bid# IMESD4

ESD Item	IMESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
30-556	Buff	6	Pkg			\$ -		
						\$ -		
	<u>6 PLY, 22" X 28", 50 Sheets/Pkg.,</u> Grain Long, (Each package							
30-558	Black	10	Pkg			\$ -		
30-559	Royal Blue	6	Pkg			\$ -		
30-560	Azure	6	Pkg			\$ -		
30-561	Ginger/Brown	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-562	Canary	10	Pkg			\$ -		
30-565	Kelly Green	8	Pkg			\$ -		
30-566	Emerald Green	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-567	Red	10	Pkg			\$ -		
30-569	Lemon Yellow	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-570	White	0	Pkg			\$ -		
						\$ -		
TAGBOARD								All or none Category
	<u>Manila, 150# Stock, 100 Sheets/Pkg.,</u> Each package Individually Shrink- Wrapped; <i>Product shall be delivered</i>							
30-530	9 x 12 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-531	12 x 18 Stock, 100shts/pkg	3	Pkg			\$ -		
30-532	18 x 24 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-533	24 x 36 Stock, 100shts/pkg	6	Pkg			\$ -		
	<u>White, 150# Stock, 100 Sheets/Pkg</u>							
30-534	9 x 12 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-535	12 x 18 Stock, 100shts/pkg	11	Pkg			\$ -		
30-536	18 x 24 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-537	24 x 36 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
	<u>Chart-Ruled Tagboard, 24"x36", Nifty</u>							
30-572	24 x 36 Stock, 100 shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
						\$ -		
CONSTRUCTION PAPER								All or none Category
	100% Sulfite pulp, individually film wrapped PACON TRU-RAY or Approved Equal <u>9" X 12" Inch, 76 Lb., 50 Sheets/Pkg.,</u>							
31-282	Spring/Light Green	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-283	Festive/Holiday Green	8	Cs			\$ -		
31-284	Dark Green	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-285	Brilliant/Hot Lime	15	Cs			\$ -		
31-286	Light Yellow	2	Cs			\$ -		
31-287	Yellow	14	Cs			\$ -		
31-289	Pumpkin	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-290	Orange	13	Cs			\$ -		
31-291	Gold	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-292	Red	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-294	Festive/Holiday Red	5	Cs			\$ -		
31-296	Shocking/Hot Pink	12	Cs			\$ -		
31-298	Pink	15	Cs			\$ -		
31-299	Magenta	6	Cs			\$ -		
31-300	Lilac	12	Cs			\$ -		
31-301	Violet	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-302	Purple	6	Cs			\$ -		
31-303	Royal Blue	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-304	Blue	8	Cs			\$ -		

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Art-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:

AWARD Highlighted In Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

Discount School Supply

% for Non-resident California, none, must reference Bid# IMESD4

ESD Item	IMESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
31-305	Turquoise	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-306	Sky Blue	15	Cs			\$ -		
31-307	White	40	Cs			\$ -		
31-308	Salmon	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-310	Warm Brown	6	Cs			\$ -		
31-311	Dark Brown	8	Cs			\$ -		
31-312	Gray	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-314	Black	15	Cs			\$ -		
31-500	Assorted Colors	0	Cs			\$ -		
subtotal=		5	pallets			\$ -		
12 x 18 Inch , 76 Lb., 50 Sheets/Pkg., 25 pks/case								
31-318	Festive/Holiday Green	20	Cs			\$ -		
31-319	Dark Green	3	Cs			\$ -		
31-320	Brilliant/Hot Lime	6	Cs			\$ -		
31-321	Light Yellow	3	Cs			\$ -		
31-322	Yellow	5	Cs			\$ -		
31-325	Orange	15	Cs			\$ -		
31-324	Pumpkin	4	Cs			\$ -		
31-326	Gold	2	Cs			\$ -		
31-327	Red	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-329	Festive/Holiday Red	12	Cs			\$ -		
31-331	Shocking/Hot Pink	3	Cs			\$ -		
31-333	Pink	3	Cs			\$ -		
31-334	Magenta	2	Cs			\$ -		
31-335	Lilac	8	Cs			\$ -		
31-336	Violet	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-337	Purple	4	Cs			\$ -		
31-338	Royal Blue	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-339	Blue	5	Cs			\$ -		
31-340	Turquoise	8	Cs			\$ -		
31-341	Sky Blue	8	Cs			\$ -		
31-342	White	80	Cs			\$ -		
31-343	Salmon	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-345	Warm Brown	10	Cs			\$ -		
31-346	Dark Brown	3	Cs			\$ -		
31-347	Gray	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-349	Black	32	Cs			\$ -		
31-501	Assorted Colors	4	Cs			\$ -		
subtotal=		6	pallets			\$ -		

Pricing Firm Until:

Delivery Date:

Terms:

Minimum Order

Vendor

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Art-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:

AWARD Highlighted In Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

Pyramid School Products

% for Non-resident Florida, none, must reference Bid# 015-ART(IMESD)

ESD Item	IMESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
MISCELLANEOUS ART								
30-002	Watercolor Paints, Studio Tray Set, 8 color, Snap Shut, w/Brush Prang 80525 or Approved Equal	200	Set	\$ 1.15	set	\$ 230.00	Prang	
30-004	Oil Pastels, 12-Colors/Set, Pentel PHN-	250	Set	\$ 0.74	set	\$ 185.00	Pentel	
					set	\$ -		
						\$ 415.00		
PLASTIC MODELING CLAY								
1 Lb. Pkg., Oil Base, Dixon Prang #200 or Approved Equal								
30-020	Blue	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-021	Brown	40	Pkg	\$ 0.89		\$ 35.60	Sargent	
30-022	Cream	38	Pkg	\$ 0.89		\$ 33.82	Sargent	
30-023	Gray	40	Pkg	\$ 0.89		\$ 35.60	Sargent	
30-024	Green	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-025	Red	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-026	Yellow	20	Pkg	\$ 0.89		\$ 17.80	Sargent	
30-027	Assorted Colors	48	Pkg	\$ 0.89		\$ 42.72	Sargent	
	subtotal=	31	Ctn			\$ 165.54		
30-029	Model Magic Clay, White, 2 lb/Bucket, 2 Bkts/Ctn, BIN57440 or	10	Ctn	\$ 23.90		\$ 239.00	Crayola	
30-030	Colored Pencil, W/O Erasers 12/Set, Prang 20270 or Approved Equal	700	Set	\$ 0.79		\$ 553.00	Sargent	
WAX CRAYONS								
3 5/8 x 5/16, (Wrapped), Label Shall State Color, Prang or Approved Equal								
30-035	8 Colors/Box, 12 Boxes/Carton	23	Ctn	\$ 2.70		\$ 62.10	Prang	
30-036	16 Colors/Box, 12 Boxes/Carton	70	Ctn	\$ 4.92		\$ 344.40	Prang	
						\$ 406.50		
30-046	Rubber Cement, 4 Oz. Jar, 12/Carton, Elmer's or Approved Equal	45	Ctn	\$ 10.38		\$ 467.10	Elmers	
WHITE GLUE								
Elmer's Glue-All or Approved								
30-060	1 1/4 Oz. Squeeze Bottle, 12/Carton	10	Ctn	\$ 7.56		\$ 75.60	Elmers	
30-061	4 Oz. Squeeze Bottle, 12/Carton	50	Ctn	\$ 7.92		\$ 396.00	Elmers	
30-062	8 Oz. Squeeze Bottle, 12/Carton	30	Ctn	\$ 12.36		\$ 370.80	Elmers	
30-067	Gallon, Plastic Jar, 2 Gal/Carton	10	Ctn	\$ 13.84		\$ 138.40	Elmers	
						\$ 1,447.90		
GLUESTICKS								
30-074	Glue Sticks, Solid, 0.28 Oz. 12/Pkg 888 Pkg, Note: District will accept packages of 12 ct only, CLI #94028 or Approved Equal	400	Pkg	\$ 1.56		\$ 624.00	Dixon	
GLITTER								
1lb, Shaker								
30-085	Blue, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	18	Ea	No Bid		No Bid		
30-086	Gold, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	24	Ea	No Bid		No Bid		
30-087	Green, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	0	Ea	No Bid		No Bid		

All or none Category

All or none Category

All or none Category

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Art-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:

AWARD Highlighted In Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

Pyramid School Products

% for Non-resident Florida, none, must reference Bid# 015-ART(IMESD)

ESD Item	IMESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
30-088	Red, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	0	Ea	No Bid		No Bid		
30-089	Silver, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	30	Ea	No Bid		No Bid		
subtotal=		3	cartons			\$ -		

TEMPERA PAINT

All or none Category

first Quality, 16 oz. Liquid,
12/Case Bestemp, Prang, Sargent
Art or Approved Equal

30-159	Red	15	Cs	\$ 11.40		\$ 171.00	Sargent Art Time	
30-160	Orange	2	Cs	\$ 11.40		\$ 22.80	Sargent Art Time	
30-161	Yellow	20	Cs	\$ 11.40		\$ 228.00	Sargent Art Time	
30-162	Green	15	Cs	\$ 11.40		\$ 171.00	Sargent Art Time	
30-163	Blue	18	Cs	\$ 11.40		\$ 205.20	Sargent Art Time	
30-164	Violet	2	Cs	\$ 11.40		\$ 22.80	Sargent Art Time	
30-165	Magenta	15	Cs	\$ 11.40		\$ 171.00	Sargent Art Time	
30-166	Brown	3	Cs	\$ 11.40		\$ 34.20	Sargent Art Time	
30-167	Black	15	Cs	\$ 11.40		\$ 171.00	Sargent Art Time	
30-168	White	30	Cs	\$ 11.40		\$ 342.00	Sargent Art Time	
subtotal=		2	pallets			\$ 1,539.00		

BUTCHER PAPER

All or none Category

Non-Coated Heavy 50#, 36" x 1000'
length ROLL, Min. Brightness: 75,
Opacity: 75, Smooth Finish,
Individually Wrapped, Dual Finish or
Approved Equal

30-469	White	50	Roll	\$ 34.89		\$ 1,744.50	Pacon	
30-470	Brown	15	Roll	\$ 36.05		\$ 540.75	Pacon	
30-471	Holiday Red/Flame Red	15	Roll	\$ 44.54		\$ 668.10	Pacon	
30-472	Scarlet	0	Roll			\$ -	Pacon	
30-473	Canary Yellow	15	Roll	\$ 42.51		\$ 637.65	Pacon	
30-474	Autumn Gold	2	Roll	\$ 43.95		\$ 87.90	Pacon	
30-475	Orange	10	Roll	\$ 42.42		\$ 424.20	Pacon	
30-476	Light Green	0	Roll			\$ -	Pacon	
30-477	Brite Green	8	Roll	\$ 46.66		\$ 373.28	Pacon	
30-478	Emerald Green	10	Roll	\$ 34.34		\$ 343.40	Pacon	
30-479	Light/Sky Blue	10	Roll	\$ 41.91		\$ 419.10	Pacon	
30-480	Brite Blue	12	Roll	\$ 44.17		\$ 530.04	Pacon	
30-481	Dark Blue	7	Roll	\$ 36.32		\$ 254.24	Pacon	
30-482	Pink	8	Roll	\$ 41.05		\$ 328.40	Pacon	
30-483	Black	30	Roll	\$ 39.29		\$ 1,178.70	Pacon	
30-484	Purple	8	Roll	\$ 41.89		\$ 335.12	Pacon	
subtotal=		5	pallets			\$ 7,865.38		

RAILROAD BOARD

All or none Category

4 PLY, 22" x 28", 100 Sheets/Pkg.,
Grain Long, (Each package

30-540	Black	10	Pkg	\$ 17.89		\$ 178.90	Pacon	
30-541	Royal Blue	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-542	Azure	6	Pkg	\$ 17.89		\$ 107.34	Pacon	
30-544	Canary	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-548	Kelly Green	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-549	Emerald Green	12	Pkg	\$ 17.89		\$ 214.68	Pacon	
30-550	Red	5	Pkg	\$ 17.89		\$ 89.45	Pacon	
30-551	Orange	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-552	Lemon Yellow	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-553	White	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-554	Purple	0	Pkg			\$ -		

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Art-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:

AWARD Highlighted In Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

Pyramid School Products

% for Non-resident Florida, none, must reference Bid# 015-ART(IMESD)

ESD Item	IMESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
30-556	Buff	6	Pkg			\$ -		
						\$ 590.37		
	<u>6 PLY, 22" X 28", 50 Sheets/Pkg.,</u> Grain Long, (Each package							
30-558	Black	10	Pkg			\$ -		
30-559	Royal Blue	6	Pkg			\$ -		
30-560	Azure	6	Pkg			\$ -		
30-561	Ginger/Brown	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-562	Canary	10	Pkg			\$ -		
30-565	Kelly Green	8	Pkg			\$ -		
30-566	Emerald Green	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-567	Red	10	Pkg			\$ -		
30-569	Lemon Yellow	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-570	White	0	Pkg			\$ -		
						\$ -		
TAGBOARD								All or none Category
	<u>Manila, 150# Stock, 100 Sheets/Pkg.,</u> Each package Individually Shrink- Wrapped; <i>Product shall be delivered</i>							
30-530	9 x 12 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-531	12 x 18 Stock, 100shts/pkg	3	Pkg	\$ 4.13		\$ 12.39	Pacon	6 pkgs/cs
30-532	18 x 24 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-533	24 x 36 Stock, 100shts/pkg	6	Pkg	\$ 17.54		\$ 105.24	Pacon	1 pkg/cs
	<u>White, 150# Stock, 100 Sheets/Pkg</u>							
30-534	9 x 12 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-535	12 x 18 Stock, 100shts/pkg	11	Pkg	\$ 4.33		\$ 47.63	Pacon	6 pkgs/cs
30-536	18 x 24 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-537	24 x 36 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg	\$ 17.54		\$ -	Pacon	1 pkg/cs
	<u>Chart-Ruled Tagboard, 24"x36", Nifty</u>							
30-572	24 x 36 Stock, 100 shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
						\$ 165.26		
CONSTRUCTION PAPER								All or none Category
	100% Sulfite pulp, individually film wrapped PACON TRU-RAY or Approved Equal							
	<u>9" X 12" Inch, 76 Lb., 50 Sheets/Pkg.,</u>							
31-282	Spring/Light Green	0	Cs			\$ -	Pacon/TruRay	
31-283	Festive/Holiday Green	8	Cs	\$ 58.50		\$ 468.00	Pacon/TruRay	
31-284	Dark Green	0	Cs			\$ -	Pacon/TruRay	
31-285	Brilliant/Hot Lime	15	Cs	\$ 60.25		\$ 903.75	Pacon/TruRay	
31-286	Light Yellow	2	Cs	\$ 53.00		\$ 106.00	Pacon/TruRay	
31-287	Yellow	14	Cs	\$ 54.00		\$ 756.00	Pacon/TruRay	
31-289	Pumpkin	0	Cs			\$ -	Pacon/TruRay	
31-290	Orange	13	Cs	\$ 55.00		\$ 715.00	Pacon/TruRay	
31-291	Gold	0	Cs			\$ -	Pacon/TruRay	
31-292	Red	0	Cs			\$ -	Pacon/TruRay	
31-294	Festive/Holiday Red	5	Cs	\$ 55.25		\$ 276.25	Pacon/TruRay	
31-296	Shocking/Hot Pink	12	Cs	\$ 56.00		\$ 672.00	Pacon/TruRay	
31-298	Pink	15	Cs	\$ 55.50		\$ 832.50	Pacon/TruRay	
31-299	Magenta	6	Cs	\$ 59.00		\$ 354.00	Pacon/TruRay	
31-300	Lilac	12	Cs	\$ 51.50		\$ 618.00	Pacon/TruRay	
31-301	Violet	0	Cs			\$ -	Pacon/TruRay	
31-302	Purple	6	Cs	\$ 57.00		\$ 342.00	Pacon/TruRay	
31-303	Royal Blue	0	Cs			\$ -	Pacon/TruRay	
31-304	Blue	8	Cs	\$ 57.00		\$ 456.00	Pacon/TruRay	

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Art-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:

AWARD Highlighted In Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

Pyramid School Products

% for Non-resident Florida, none, must reference Bid# 015-ART(IMESD)

ESD Item	IMESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
31-305	Turquoise	0	Cs			\$ -	Pacon/TruRay	
31-306	Sky Blue	15	Cs	\$ 51.50		\$ 772.50	Pacon/TruRay	
31-307	White	40	Cs	\$ 47.50		\$ 1,900.00	Pacon/TruRay	
31-308	Salmon	0	Cs			\$ -	Pacon/TruRay	
31-310	Warm Brown	6	Cs	\$ 51.00		\$ 306.00	Pacon/TruRay	
31-311	Dark Brown	8	Cs	\$ 54.00		\$ 432.00	Pacon/TruRay	
31-312	Gray	0	Cs			\$ -	Pacon/TruRay	
31-314	Black	15	Cs	\$ 48.50		\$ 727.50	Pacon/TruRay	
31-500	Assorted Colors	0	Cs			\$ -	Pacon/TruRay	
subtotal=		5	pallets			\$ 10,637.50		
12 x 18 Inch, 76 Lb., 50 Sheets/Pkg., 25 pkgs/case								
31-318	Festive/Holiday Green	20	Cs	\$ 56.25		\$ 1,125.00		
31-319	Dark Green	3	Cs	\$ 54.50		\$ 163.50		
31-320	Brilliant/Hot Lime	6	Cs	\$ 57.75		\$ 346.50		
31-321	Light Yellow	3	Cs	\$ 50.25		\$ 150.75		
31-322	Yellow	5	Cs	\$ 52.00		\$ 260.00		
31-325	Orange	15	Cs	\$ 52.75		\$ 791.25		
31-324	Pumpkin	4	Cs	\$ 52.00		\$ 208.00		
31-326	Gold	2	Cs	\$ 51.00		\$ 102.00		
31-327	Red	0	Cs	\$ -		\$ -		
31-329	Festive/Holiday Red	12	Cs	\$ 52.50		\$ 630.00		
31-331	Shocking/Hot Pink	3	Cs	\$ 54.00		\$ 162.00		
31-333	Pink	3	Cs	\$ 53.25		\$ 159.75		
31-334	Magenta	2	Cs	\$ 57.00		\$ 114.00		
31-335	Lilac	8	Cs	\$ 49.75		\$ 398.00		
31-336	Violet	0	Cs	\$ -		\$ -		
31-337	Purple	4	Cs	\$ 54.75		\$ 219.00		
31-338	Royal Blue	0	Cs	\$ -		\$ -		
31-339	Blue	5	Cs	\$ 55.25		\$ 276.25		
31-340	Turquoise	8	Cs	\$ 57.25		\$ 458.00		
31-341	Sky Blue	8	Cs	\$ 49.75		\$ 398.00		
31-342	White	80	Cs	\$ 45.25		\$ 3,620.00		
31-343	Salmon	0	Cs	\$ -		\$ -		
31-345	Warm Brown	10	Cs	\$ 48.75		\$ 487.50		
31-346	Dark Brown	3	Cs	\$ 51.75		\$ 155.25		
31-347	Gray	0	Cs	\$ -		\$ -		
31-349	Black	32	Cs	\$ 46.25		\$ 1,480.00		
31-501	Assorted Colors	4	Cs	\$ 59.75		\$ 239.00		
subtotal=		6	pallets			\$ 11,943.75		

Pricing Firm Until: 12-31-2014

Delivery Date: 21-30 days ARO

Terms: Net 30

Minimum Order	Vendor
\$ 600.00	Dixon/Prang
\$ 1,200.00	Sargent
\$ 750.00	Elmers
\$ 2,600.00	Pacon

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Art-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:

AWARD Highlighted In Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

AFP Industries, Inc.
% for Non-resident Florida, none

ESD Item #	ESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
MISCELLANEOUS ART								
30-002	Watercolor Paints, Studio Tray Set, 8 color, Snap Shut, w/Brush Prang 80525 or Approved Equal	200	Set	\$ 1.19	set	\$ 238.00	Dixon/Prang	
30-004	Oil Pastels, 12-Colors/Set, Pentel PHN-	250	Set	\$ 3.13	set	\$ 782.50	Dixon/Prang	
					set	\$ -		
						\$ 1,020.50		
PLASTIC MODELING CLAY								
1 Lb. Pkg., Oil Base, Dixon Prang #200 or Approved Equal								
30-020	Blue	0	Pkg			\$ -		All or none Category
30-021	Brown	40	Pkg			\$ -		
30-022	Cream	38	Pkg			\$ -		
30-023	Gray	40	Pkg			\$ -		
30-024	Green	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-025	Red	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-026	Yellow	20	Pkg			\$ -		
30-027	Assorted Colors	48	Pkg			\$ -		
	subtotal=	31	Ctn			\$ -		
30-029	Model Magic Clay, White, 2 lb/Bucket, 2 Bkts/Ctn, BIN57440 or	10	Ctn			\$ -		
30-030	Colored Pencil, W/O Erasers 12/Set, Prang 20270 or Approved Equal	700	Set	\$ 1.03		\$ 721.00	Dixon/Prang	
WAX CRAYONS								
3 5/8 x 5/16, (Wrapped), Label Shall State Color, Prang or Approved Equal								
30-035	8 Colors/Box, 12 Boxes/Carton	23	Ctn	\$ 2.88	Ctn	\$ 66.24	Dixon/Prang	All or none Category
30-036	16 Colors/Box, 12 Boxes/Carton	70	Ctn	\$ 5.16	Ctn	\$ 361.20	Dixon/Prang	
						\$ 427.44		
30-046	Rubber Cement, 4 Oz. Jar, 12/Carton, Elmer's or Approved Equal	45	Ctn			\$ -		
WHITE GLUE								
Elmer's Glue-All or Approved								
30-060	1 1/4 Oz. Squeeze Bottle, 12/Carton	10	Ctn			\$ -		All or none Category
30-061	4 Oz. Squeeze Bottle, 12/Carton	50	Ctn			\$ -		
30-062	8 Oz. Squeeze Bottle, 12/Carton	30	Ctn			\$ -		
30-067	Gallon, Plastic Jar, 2 Gal/Carton	10	Ctn			\$ -		
						\$ -		
GLUESTICKS								
30-074	Glue Sticks, Solid, 0.28 Oz. 12/Pkg 888 Pkg, Note: District will accept packages of 12 ct only, CLI #94028 or Approved Equal	400	Pkg	\$ 2.04		\$ 816.00	Dixon	
GLITTER								
1lb, Shaker								
30-085	Blue, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	18	Ea			\$ -		All or none Category
30-086	Gold, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	24	Ea			\$ -		
30-087	Green, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	0	Ea			\$ -		

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Art-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:

AWARD Highlighted In Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

AFP Industries, Inc.
% for Non-resident Florida, none

ESD Item #	IMESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
30-088	Red, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	0	Ea			\$ -		
30-089	Silver, PAC917XX or Approved Equal	30	Ea			\$ -		
subtotal=		3	cartons			\$ -		

TEMPERA PAINT

All or none Category

first Quality, 16 oz. Liquid,
12/Case Bestemp, Prang, Sargent
Art or Approved Equal

30-159	Red	15	Cs	\$ 15.12	Cs	\$ 226.80	Dixon/Prang	
30-160	Orange	2	Cs	\$ 15.12	Cs	\$ 30.24	Dixon/Prang	
30-161	Yellow	20	Cs	\$ 15.12	Cs	\$ 302.40	Dixon/Prang	
30-162	Green	15	Cs	\$ 15.12	Cs	\$ 226.80	Dixon/Prang	
30-163	Blue	18	Cs	\$ 15.12	Cs	\$ 272.16	Dixon/Prang	
30-164	Violet	2	Cs	\$ 15.12	Cs	\$ 30.24	Dixon/Prang	
30-165	Magenta	15	Cs	\$ 15.12	Cs	\$ 226.80	Dixon/Prang	
30-166	Brown	3	Cs	\$ 15.12	Cs	\$ 45.36	Dixon/Prang	
30-167	Black	15	Cs	\$ 15.12	Cs	\$ 226.80	Dixon/Prang	
30-168	White	30	Cs	\$ 15.12	Cs	\$ 453.60	Dixon/Prang	
subtotal=		2	pallets			\$ 2,041.20		

BUTCHER PAPER

All or none Category

Non-Coated Heavy 50#, 36" x 1000'
length ROLL, Min. Brightness: 75,
Opacity: 75, Smooth Finish,
Individually Wrapped, Dual Finish or
Approved Equal

30-469	White	50	Roll	\$ 35.65	Roll	\$ 1,782.50		
30-470	Brown	15	Roll	\$ 36.21	Roll	\$ 543.15		
30-471	Holiday Red/Flame Red	15	Roll	\$ 45.55	Roll	\$ 683.25		
30-472	Scarlet	0	Roll	\$ 39.25	Roll	\$ -		
30-473	Canary Yellow	15	Roll	\$ 43.45	Roll	\$ 651.75		
30-474	Autumn Gold	2	Roll	\$ 44.09	Roll	\$ 88.18		
30-475	Orange	10	Roll	\$ 43.47	Roll	\$ 434.70		
30-476	Light Green	0	Roll	\$ 44.09	Roll	\$ -		
30-477	Brite Green	8	Roll	\$ 48.37	Roll	\$ 386.96		
30-478	Emerald Green	10	Roll	\$ 34.41	Roll	\$ 344.10		
30-479	Light/Sky Blue	10	Roll	\$ 42.89	Roll	\$ 428.90		
30-480	Brite Blue	12	Roll	\$ 45.89	Roll	\$ 550.68		
30-481	Dark Blue	7	Roll	\$ 37.15	Roll	\$ 260.05		
30-482	Pink	8	Roll	\$ 42.13	Roll	\$ 337.04		
30-483	Black	30	Roll	\$ 40.17	Roll	\$ 1,205.10		
30-484	Purple	8	Roll	\$ 42.89	Roll	\$ 343.12		
subtotal=		5	pallets			\$ 8,039.48		

RAILROAD BOARD

All or none Category

4 PLY, 22" x 28", 100 Sheets/Pkg.,
Grain Long, (Each package

30-540	Black	10	Pkg			\$ -		
30-541	Royal Blue	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-542	Azure	6	Pkg			\$ -		
30-544	Canary	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-548	Kelly Green	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-549	Emerald Green	12	Pkg			\$ -		
30-550	Red	5	Pkg			\$ -		
30-551	Orange	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-552	Lemon Yellow	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-553	White	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-554	Purple	0	Pkg			\$ -		

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Art-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:

AWARD Highlighted In Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

AFP Industries, Inc.
% for Non-resident Florida, none

ESD Item	IMESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
30-556	Buff	6	Pkg			\$ -		
						\$ -		
	<u>6 PLY, 22" X 28", 50 Sheets/Pkg.,</u> Grain Long, (Each package							
30-558	Black	10	Pkg			\$ -		
30-559	Royal Blue	6	Pkg			\$ -		
30-560	Azure	6	Pkg			\$ -		
30-561	Ginger/Brown	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-562	Canary	10	Pkg			\$ -		
30-565	Kelly Green	8	Pkg			\$ -		
30-566	Emerald Green	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-567	Red	10	Pkg			\$ -		
30-569	Lemon Yellow	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-570	White	0	Pkg			\$ -		
						\$ -		
TAGBOARD								All or none Category
	<u>Manila, 150# Stock, 100 Sheets/Pkg.,</u> Each package Individually Shrink- Wrapped; <i>Product shall be delivered</i>							
30-530	9 x 12 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-531	12 x 18 Stock, 100shts/pkg	3	Pkg			\$ -		
30-532	18 x 24 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-533	24 x 36 Stock, 100shts/pkg	6	Pkg			\$ -		
	<u>White, 150# Stock, 100 Sheets/Pkg</u>							
30-534	9 x 12 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-535	12 x 18 Stock, 100shts/pkg	11	Pkg			\$ -		
30-536	18 x 24 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
30-537	24 x 36 Stock, 100shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
	<u>Chart-Ruled Tagboard, 24"x36", Nifty</u>							
30-572	24 x 36 Stock, 100 shts/pkg	0	Pkg			\$ -		
						\$ -		
CONSTRUCTION PAPER								All or none Category
	100% Sulfite pulp, individually film wrapped PACON TRU-RAY or Approved Equal							
	<u>9" X 12" Inch, 76 Lb., 50 Sheets/Pkg.,</u>							
31-282	Spring/Light Green	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-283	Festive/Holiday Green	8	Cs			\$ -		
31-284	Dark Green	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-285	Brilliant/Hot Lime	15	Cs			\$ -		
31-286	Light Yellow	2	Cs			\$ -		
31-287	Yellow	14	Cs			\$ -		
31-289	Pumpkin	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-290	Orange	13	Cs			\$ -		
31-291	Gold	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-292	Red	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-294	Festive/Holiday Red	5	Cs			\$ -		
31-296	Shocking/Hot Pink	12	Cs			\$ -		
31-298	Pink	15	Cs			\$ -		
31-299	Magenta	6	Cs			\$ -		
31-300	Lilac	12	Cs			\$ -		
31-301	Violet	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-302	Purple	6	Cs			\$ -		
31-303	Royal Blue	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-304	Blue	8	Cs			\$ -		

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Art-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:

AWARD Highlighted In Light Blue

Pending Sample Evaluation

No Award

AFP Industries, Inc.

% for Non-resident Florida, none

ESD Item	IMESD Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
31-305	Turquoise	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-306	Sky Blue	15	Cs			\$ -		
31-307	White	40	Cs			\$ -		
31-308	Salmon	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-310	Warm Brown	6	Cs			\$ -		
31-311	Dark Brown	8	Cs			\$ -		
31-312	Gray	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-314	Black	15	Cs			\$ -		
31-500	Assorted Colors	0	Cs			\$ -		
subtotal=		5	pallets			\$ -		
12 x 18 Inch , 76 Lb., 50 Sheets/Pkg., 25 pkgs/case								
31-318	Festive/Holiday Green	20	Cs			\$ -		
31-319	Dark Green	3	Cs			\$ -		
31-320	Brilliant/Hot Lime	6	Cs			\$ -		
31-321	Light Yellow	3	Cs			\$ -		
31-322	Yellow	5	Cs			\$ -		
31-325	Orange	15	Cs			\$ -		
31-324	Pumpkin	4	Cs			\$ -		
31-326	Gold	2	Cs			\$ -		
31-327	Red	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-329	Festive/Holiday Red	12	Cs			\$ -		
31-331	Shocking/Hot Pink	3	Cs			\$ -		
31-333	Pink	3	Cs			\$ -		
31-334	Magenta	2	Cs			\$ -		
31-335	Lilac	8	Cs			\$ -		
31-336	Violet	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-337	Purple	4	Cs			\$ -		
31-338	Royal Blue	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-339	Blue	5	Cs			\$ -		
31-340	Turquoise	8	Cs			\$ -		
31-341	Sky Blue	8	Cs			\$ -		
31-342	White	80	Cs			\$ -		
31-343	Salmon	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-345	Warm Brown	10	Cs			\$ -		
31-346	Dark Brown	3	Cs			\$ -		
31-347	Gray	0	Cs			\$ -		
31-349	Black	32	Cs			\$ -		
31-501	Assorted Colors	4	Cs			\$ -		
subtotal=		6	pallets			\$ -		

Pricing Firm Until: 12/31/2014
Delivery Date: As specified or 14 days after PO
Terms: Net 30

Minimum Order	Vendor
\$ 3,100.00	Pacon
\$ 550.00	Dixon