

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

BSN Sports

% for Non-Resident California, None

ESD Item No.	Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
BASKETBALLS--REGULATION, <u>Composite.</u>								
11-002	Wilson Evolution, SKU WTB0586R, Girls' Official size and weight 28.5", microfiber composite leather cover, Pebbled composite channels, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	7	Ea	\$ 58.44	Ea	\$ 409.08	Wilson	<div style="background-color: black; color: white; padding: 5px; text-align: center;"> Please Note Special Terms and Conditions below specification for the following items specified in this category </div>
11-001	Wilson Evolution, SKU WTB0516R, Boys' Official size and weight 29.5", microfiber composite leather cover, Pebbled composite channels, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	8	Ea	\$ 58.44	Ea	\$ 467.52	Wilson	
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA) specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/basketball/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
TENNIS BALLS—COMPETITION								
10-040	Wilson US Open-Extra Duty Felt, Optic Yellow, SKU WRT1071, Made with premium tex/tech industries felt, 3 balls/tube, USTA and ITF approved for competitive play	100	Tube	\$ 4.50	Tube	\$ 450.00	Wilson	<div style="background-color: black; color: white; padding: 5px; text-align: center;"> Please Note Special Terms and Conditions below specification for the following items specified in this category </div>
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA), specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/tennis/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
VOLLEYBALLS—COMPETITION								
10-058	Wilson i-COR, SKU WTH7720XWHI, indoor use, Composite leather, Official size and weight, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	12	Ea	\$ 72.53	Ea	\$ 870.36	Wilson	<div style="background-color: black; color: white; padding: 5px; text-align: center;"> Please Note Special Terms and Conditions below specification for the following items specified in this category </div>
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA), specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/volleyball/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
BASKETBALLS								
10-110	Rubber, Junior size and weight, 27.5", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit Enduro CB6 or Approved Equal	150	Ea	\$ 3.78	Ea	\$ 567.00	Voit	<div style="background-color: black; color: white; padding: 5px; text-align: center;"> Please Note Special Terms and Conditions below specification for the following items specified in this category </div>
10-111	Rubber, Intermediate size and weight, 28.5-29", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit CB8 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$ 4.08	Ea	\$ 408.00	Voit	
10-112	Rubber, Official Size and weight, 29.5", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit CB2 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$ 4.28	Ea	\$ -	Voit	
FOOTBALLS & FOOTBALL ITEMS								
10-120	Junior (6) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F100 or Approved Equal	30	Ea	\$ 3.53	Ea	\$ 105.90	Voit	<div style="background-color: black; color: white; padding: 5px; text-align: center;"> Please Note Special Terms and Conditions below specification for the following items specified in this category </div>
10-121	Intermediate (8) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F200 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$ 3.73	Ea	\$ -	Voit	
10-122	Official (9) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F300 or Approved Equal	80	Ea	\$ 4.03	Ea	\$ 322.40	Voit	
SOCCER BALLS								

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

BSN Sports

10-150	SIZE 4, Rubber cover, butyl bladder, nylon wound, Voit CS66 or Approved Equal	150	Ea	\$	3.08	Ea	\$	462.00	Voit
10-151	SIZE 5, Rubber, butyl bladder, nylon wound, Voit CS33 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$	3.28	Ea	\$	328.00	Voit
TETHER BALL									
10-175	Rubber, two ply butyl bladder, with reinforced rope attachment, and includes nylon braided rope, Voit VCT850HX or Approved Equal	30	Ea	\$	6.18	Ea	\$	185.40	Voit
VOLLEYBALL									
10-181	Volley Starter, Synthetic Leather, Official Size, Volley Starter, Official Size and weight (approx. 5.5 oz.), Yellow Color, Mikasa or approved equal	0	Ea	\$	18.00	Ea	\$	-	MacGregor
10-184	Volley Starter, Official Size and weight (approx. 5.5 oz.), Yellow Color, Mikasa Starterone Training Series VT1 or Approved Equal	20	Ea	\$	12.65	Ea	\$	253.00	Mikasa
10-185	Volley Starter, Oversized #2 size and weight (approx 7 oz.) Yellow color, Mikasa Starter Two Training Series VT2 or Approved Equal	15	Ea	\$	13.89	Ea	\$	208.35	Mikasa
FOAM BALLS W/FIRM EXTERIOR COVER									
Bid all or none in this category									
10-190	Footballs, 9 3/4" Long, , Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	150	Ea	\$	2.50	Ea	\$	375.00	US Games
10-191	Soccer Balls, 7.5" Diameter Min., Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$	6.03	Ea	\$	603.00	Poof
10-192	Volleyballs, 7.5" Diameter Min., Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	30	Ea	\$	5.91	Ea	\$	177.30	US Games
PLAYGROUND BALLS, RUBBER									
Bid all or none in this category									
First quality, with replaceable valves, voit heavy duty or Approved Equal									
10-200	5", Red	0	Ea	\$	1.68	Ea	\$	-	Voit
10-201	6", Red	50	Ea	\$	1.86	Ea	\$	93.00	Voit
10-202	7", Red	0	Ea	\$	2.60	Ea	\$	-	Voit
10-203	8 1/2", Red	50	Ea	\$	2.58	Ea	\$	129.00	Voit
10-204	8 1/2", Green	150	Ea	\$	2.58	Ea	\$	387.00	Voit
10-205	8 1/2", Blue	50	Ea	\$	2.58	Ea	\$	129.00	Voit
10-206	8 1/2", Yellow	0	Ea	\$	2.58	Ea	\$	-	Voit
10-207	10", Red	40	Ea	\$	3.33	Ea	\$	133.20	Voit
10-208	13", Red	30	Ea	\$	7.63	Ea	\$	228.90	Voit
10-209	16" Red	15	Ea	\$	9.28		\$	139.20	Voit
							\$	1,239.30	
JUMP ROPES									
Bid all or none in this category									
10-243	9 Ft (length), 5/16" (diameter) heavy weight woven cotton cord, wooden spring loaded handles, CSI 9534 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$	1.26	Ea	\$	-	BSN
10-245	7 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95013 or Approved Equal	50	Ea	\$	0.78	Ea	\$	39.00	US Games
10-246	8 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95014 or Approved Equal	60	Ea	\$	0.85	Ea	\$	51.00	US Games
10-247	16 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95014 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$	1.88	Ea	\$	188.00	US Games

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

BSN Sports

BADMINTON ITEMS

10-255	Rackets, Steel Shaft, Nylon String, Top Quality Sportcraft Hardshot or Approved Equal	50	Ea	\$ 2.53	Ea	\$ 126.50	BSN
10-258	Shuttle Cock, Medium Speed, Nylon, PVC Base, 6 ea/tube, CSI 0205 or Approved Equal	20	Tube	\$ 4.28	Tube	\$ 85.60	MacGregor

BASKETBALL NET

10-266	Net, Basketball, Nylon, Game Quality	20	Pair	\$ 1.92	Pair	\$ 38.40	MacGregor
10-267	Net, Basketball, Nylon, Anti-Whip	30	Pair	\$ 3.92	Pair	\$ 117.60	MacGregor

ATHLETIC WHISTLES

10-270	Metal Whistle, Nickel Plated, Metal Lanyard Ring, 12/Box, CSI 13083 or Approved Equal	30	Doz	\$ 12.00	Doz	\$ 360.00	MacGregor
10-272	Lanyard, 100% Nylon w/Clamp and Swivel Black, 12/Box, CSI 1346 or approved equal	0	Doz	\$ 3.80	Doz	\$ -	MacGregor

MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES

10-280	Mesh Ball Bags, Nylon, 36", ¼" Mesh w/ Tie Cord at Top	30	Ea	\$ 3.06	Ea	\$ 91.80	BSN
10-310	Wrestling Mat Tape, 3"X36", Vinyl Reuseable	275	Roll	\$ 4.30	Ea	\$ 1,182.50	BSN
10-402	Field Lining Paint, White, Latex, 5-Gal	70	Pail	\$ 78.00	Ea	\$ 5,460.00	Perma Line

TRAINER SUPPLIES

10-301	Tape, Athletic 1.5" x 15 yds, heavy Weight 32 rolls/case	0	Cs	\$ 53.00	Cs	\$ -	BSN
10-305	Tape Underwrap, Polyurethane Foam, 2 ¾ x 30 yds, 48 Rolls/Case Cramer 214592 or Approved Equal	0	Cs	\$ 43.00	Cs	\$ -	BSN
10-367	Wipes, 6" x 6.75" (Surface Only) 160/Tub, EPA Registered Anti-Viral, Sani-Cloth HB Q551722 or Approved Equal	300	Tub	No bid	Tub	No bid	

Pricing Firm Until: 12/31/2014
Delivery Date: 4-10 Days ARO
Terms: Net 30 Days

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

Pyramid School Products

% for Non-Resident, Florida, None

ESD Item No.	Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
BASKETBALLS--REGULATION, <u>Composite.</u>								
11-002	Wilson Evolution, SKU WTB0586R, Girls' Official size and weight 28.5", microfiber composite leather cover, Pebbled composite channels, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	7	Ea	\$ 40.00	Ea	\$ 280.00	Wilson	Please Note Special Terms and Conditions below specification for the following items specified in this category
11-001	Wilson Evolution, SKU WTB0516R, Boys' Official size and weight 29.5", microfiber composite leather cover, Pebbled composite channels, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	8	Ea	\$ 40.00	Ea	\$ 320.00	Wilson	
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA) specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/basketball/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
TENNIS BALLS—COMPETITION								
10-040	Wilson US Open-Extra Duty Felt, Optic Yellow, SKU WRT1071, Made with premium tex/tech industries felt, 3 balls/tube, USTA and ITF approved for competitive play	100	Tube	\$ 2.52	Tube	\$ 252.00	Wilson	
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA), specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/tennis/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
VOLLEYBALLS—COMPETITION								
10-058	Wilson i-COR, SKU WTH7720XWHI, indoor use, Composite leather, Official size and weight, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	12	Ea	\$ 26.49	Ea	\$ 317.88	Wilson	
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA), specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/volleyball/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
BASKETBALLS								
10-110	Rubber, Junior size and weight, 27.5", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit Enduro CB6 or Approved Equal	150	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid		
10-111	Rubber, Intermediate size and weight, 28.5-29", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit CB8 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid		
10-112	Rubber, Official Size and weight, 29.5", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit CB2 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid		
FOOTBALLS & FOOTBALL ITEMS								
10-120	Junior (6) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F100 or Approved Equal	30	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid		
10-121	Intermediate (8) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F200 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid		
10-122	Official (9) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F300 or Approved Equal	80	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid		
SOCCER BALLS								

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

Pyramid School Products

10-150	SIZE 4, Rubber cover, butyl bladder, nylon wound, Voit CS66 or Approved Equal	150	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid
10-151	SIZE 5, Rubber, butyl bladder, nylon wound, Voit CS33 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid
TETHER BALL						
10-175	Rubber, two ply butyl bladder, with reinforced rope attachment, and includes nylon braided rope, Voit VCT850HX or Approved Equal	30	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid
VOLLEYBALL						
10-181	Volley Starter, Synthetic Leather, Official Size, Volley Starter, Official Size and weight (approx. 5.5 oz.), Yellow Color, Mikasa or approved equal	0	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid
10-184	Volley Starter, Official Size and weight (approx. 5.5 oz.), Yellow Color, Mikasa Starterone Training Series VT1 or Approved Equal	20	Ea	\$ 12.30	Ea	\$ 246.00
10-185	Volley Starter, Oversized #2 size and weight (approx 7 oz.) Yellow color, Mikasa Starter Two Training Series VT2 or Approved Equal	15	Ea	\$ 13.50	Ea	\$ 202.50

FOAM BALLS W/FIRM EXTERIOR COVER

10-190	Footballs, 9 3/4" Long, , Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	150	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid
10-191	Soccer Balls, 7.5" Diameter Min., Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	100	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid
10-192	Volleyballs, 7.5" Diameter Min., Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	30	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid

Bid all or none in this category

PLAYGROUND BALLS, RUBBER

First quality, with replaceable valves, voit heavy duty or Approved Equal						
10-200	5", Red	0	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid
10-201	6", Red	50	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid
10-202	7", Red	0	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid
10-203	8 1/2", Red	50	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid
10-204	8 1/2", Green	150	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid
10-205	8 1/2", Blue	50	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid
10-206	8 1/2", Yellow	0	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid
10-207	10", Red	40	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid
10-208	13", Red	30	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid
10-209	16" Red	15	Ea			

Bid all or none in this category

JUMP ROPES

10-243	9 Ft (length), 5/16" (diameter) heavy weight woven cotton cord, wooden spring loaded handles, CSI 9534 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid
10-245	7 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95013 or Approved Equal	50	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid
10-246	8 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95014 or Approved Equal	60	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid
10-247	16 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95014 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	No Bid	Ea	No Bid

Bid all or none in this category

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

Pyramid School Products

BADMINTON ITEMS

10-255	Rackets, Steel Shaft, Nylon String, Top Quality Sportcraft Hardshot or Approved Equal	50	Ea	No Bid		Ea	No Bid
10-258	Shuttle Cock, Medium Speed, Nylon, PVC Base, 6 ea/tube, CSI 0205 or Approved Equal	20	Tube	\$	4.29	Tube	\$ 85.80

BASKETBALL NET

10-266	Net, Basketball, Nylon, Game Quality	20	Pair	\$	2.18	Pair	\$ 43.60
10-267	Net, Basketball, Nylon, Anti-Whip	30	Pair	\$	4.18	Pair	\$ 125.40

ATHLETIC WHISTLES

10-270	Metal Whistle, Nickel Plated, Metal Lanyard Ring, 12/Box, CSI 13083 or Approved Equal	30	Doz	\$	4.44	Doz	\$ 133.20
10-272	Lanyard, 100% Nylon w/Clamp and Swivel Black, 12/Box, CSI 1346 or approved equal	0	Doz	No Bid		Doz	No Bid

MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES

10-280	Mesh Ball Bags, Nylon, 36", ¼" Mesh w/ Tie Cord at Top	30	Ea	\$	3.19	Ea	\$ 95.70
10-310	Wrestling Mat Tape, 3"X36", Vinyl Reuseable	275	Roll	\$	4.40	Ea	\$ 1,210.00
10-402	Field Lining Paint, White, Latex, 5-Gal	70	Pail	No Bid		Ea	No Bid

TRAINER SUPPLIES

10-301	Tape, Athletic 1.5" x 15 yds, heavy Weight 32 rolls/case	0	Cs	No Bid		Cs	No Bid
10-305	Tape Underwrap, Polyurethane Foam, 2 ¾ x 30 yds, 48 Rolls/Case Cramer 214592 or Approved Equal	0	Cs	No Bid		Cs	No Bid
10-367	Wipes, 6" x 6.75" (Surface Only) 160/Tub, EPA Registered Anti-Viral, Sani-Cloth HB Q551722 or Approved Equal	300	Tub	\$	8.99	Tub	\$ 2,697.00

Pricing Firm Until: 12/31/2014
Delivery Date: 14-21 Days ARO
Terms: Net 30

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

Pioneer Athletics
% for Non-Resident, Oregon - NA

ESD Item No.	Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
BASKETBALLS--REGULATION, <u>Composite.</u>								
11-002	Wilson Evolution, SKU WTB0586R, Girls' Official size and weight 28.5", microfiber composite leather cover, Pebbled composite channels, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	7	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		Please Note Special Terms and Conditions below specification for the following items specified in this category
11-001	Wilson Evolution, SKU WTB0516R, Boys' Official size and weight 29.5", microfiber composite leather cover, Pebbled composite channels, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	8	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA) specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/basketball/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
TENNIS BALLS—COMPETITION								
10-040	Wilson US Open-Extra Duty Felt, Optic Yellow, SKU WRT1071, Made with premium tex/tech industries felt, 3 balls/tube, USTA and ITF approved for competitive play	100	Tube	\$ -	Tube	\$ -		
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA), specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/tennis/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
VOLLEYBALLS—COMPETITION								
10-058	Wilson i-COR, SKU WTH7720XWHI, indoor use, Composite leather, Official size and weight, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	12	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA), specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/volleyball/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
BASKETBALLS								
10-110	Rubber, Junior size and weight, 27.5", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit Enduro CB6 or Approved Equal	150	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
10-111	Rubber, Intermediate size and weight, 28.5-29", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit CB8 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
10-112	Rubber, Official Size and weight, 29.5", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit CB2 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
FOOTBALLS & FOOTBALL ITEMS								
10-120	Junior (6) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F100 or Approved Equal	30	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
10-121	Intermediate (8) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F200 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
10-122	Official (9) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F300 or Approved Equal	80	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
SOCCER BALLS								

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

Pioneer Athletics

10-150	SIZE 4, Rubber cover, butyl bladder, nylon wound, Voit CS66 or Approved Equal	150	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-151	SIZE 5, Rubber, butyl bladder, nylon wound, Voit CS33 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
TETHER BALL									
10-175	Rubber, two ply butyl bladder, with reinforced rope attachment, and includes nylon braided rope, Voit VCT850HX or Approved Equal	30	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
VOLLEYBALL									
10-181	Volley Starter, Synthetic Leather, Official Size, Volley Starter, Official Size and weight (approx. 5.5 oz.), Yellow Color, Mikasa or approved equal	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-184	Volley Starter, Official Size and weight (approx. 5.5 oz.), Yellow Color, Mikasa Starterone Training Series VT1 or Approved Equal	20	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-185	Volley Starter, Oversized #2 size and weight (approx 7 oz.) Yellow color, Mikasa Starter Two Training Series VT2 or Approved Equal	15	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
FOAM BALLS W/FIRM EXTERIOR COVER									
10-190	Footballs, 9 3/4" Long, , Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	150	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-191	Soccer Balls, 7.5" Diameter Min., Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-192	Volleyballs, 7.5" Diameter Min., Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	30	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
PLAYGROUND BALLS, RUBBER									
First quality, with replaceable valves, voit heavy duty or Approved Equal									
10-200	5", Red	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-201	6", Red	50	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-202	7", Red	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-203	8 1/2", Red	50	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-204	8 1/2", Green	150	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-205	8 1/2", Blue	50	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-206	8 1/2", Yellow	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-207	10", Red	40	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-208	13", Red	30	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-209	16" Red	15	Ea						
JUMP ROPES									
10-243	9 Ft (length), 5/16" (diameter) heavy weight woven cotton cord, wooden spring loaded handles, CSI 9534 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-245	7 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95013 or Approved Equal	50	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-246	8 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95014 or Approved Equal	60	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-247	16 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95014 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	

Bid all or none in this category

Bid all or none in this category

Bid all or none in this category

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

Pioneer Athletics

BADMINTON ITEMS

10-255	Rackets, Steel Shaft, Nylon String, Top Quality Sportcraft Hardshot or Approved Equal	50	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-
10-258	Shuttle Cock, Medium Speed, Nylon, PVC Base, 6 ea/tube, CSI 0205 or Approved Equal	20	Tube	\$	-	Tube	\$	-

BASKETBALL NET

10-266	Net, Basketball, Nylon, Game Quality	20	Pair	\$	-	Pair	\$	-
10-267	Net, Basketball, Nylon, Anti-Whip	30	Pair	\$	-	Pair	\$	-

ATHLETIC WHISTLES

10-270	Metal Whistle, Nickel Plated, Metal Lanyard Ring, 12/Box, CSI 13083 or Approved Equal	30	Doz	\$	-	Doz	\$	-
10-272	Lanyard, 100% Nylon w/Clamp and Swivel Black, 12/Box, CSI 1346 or approved equal	0	Doz	\$	-	Doz	\$	-

MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES

10-280	Mesh Ball Bags, Nylon, 36", ¼" Mesh w/ Tie Cord at Top	30	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-
10-310	Wrestling Mat Tape, 3"X36", Vinyl Reuseable	275	Roll	\$	-	Ea	\$	-
10-402	Field Lining Paint, White, Latex, 5-Gal	70	Pail	\$	45.50	Pail	\$ 3,185.00	Pioneer Frontline White
				\$	50.50	Pail	\$ 3,535.00	Pioneer Brite Stripe White Alternate

TRAINER SUPPLIES

10-301	Tape, Athletic 1.5" x 15 yds, heavy Weight 32 rolls/case	0	Cs	\$	-	Cs	\$	-
10-305	Tape Underwrap, Polyurethane Foam, 2 ¾ x 30 yds, 48 Rolls/Case Cramer 214592 or Approved Equal	0	Cs	\$	-	Cs	\$	-
10-367	Wipes, 6" x 6.75" (Surface Only) 160/Tub, EPA Registered Anti-Viral, Sani-Cloth HB Q551722 or Approved Equal	300	Tub	\$	-	Tub	\$	-

Pricing Firm Until: 7/1/2015
Delivery Date: 5 days ARO
Terms: Net 15 days

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

Merchants Paper Co.

% for Non-Resident, Oregon - NA

ESD Item No.	Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
BASKETBALLS--REGULATION, <u>Composite.</u>								
11-002	Wilson Evolution, SKU WTB0586R, Girls' Official size and weight 28.5", microfiber composite leather cover, Pebbled composite channels, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	7	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		Please Note Special Terms and Conditions below specification for the following items specified in this category
11-001	Wilson Evolution, SKU WTB0516R, Boys' Official size and weight 29.5", microfiber composite leather cover, Pebbled composite channels, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	8	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA) specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/basketball/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
TENNIS BALLS—COMPETITION								
10-040	Wilson US Open-Extra Duty Felt, Optic Yellow, SKU WRT1071, Made with premium tex/tech industries felt, 3 balls/tube, USTA and ITF approved for competitive play	100	Tube	\$ -	Tube	\$ -		
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA), specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/tennis/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
VOLLEYBALLS—COMPETITION								
10-058	Wilson i-COR, SKU WTH7720XWHI, indoor use, Composite leather, Official size and weight, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	12	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA), specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/volleyball/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
BASKETBALLS								
10-110	Rubber, Junior size and weight, 27.5", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit Enduro CB6 or Approved Equal	150	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
10-111	Rubber, Intermediate size and weight, 28.5-29", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit CB8 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
10-112	Rubber, Official Size and weight, 29.5", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit CB2 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
FOOTBALLS & FOOTBALL ITEMS								
10-120	Junior (6) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F100 or Approved Equal	30	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
10-121	Intermediate (8) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F200 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
10-122	Official (9) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F300 or Approved Equal	80	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
SOCCER BALLS								

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

Merchants Paper Co.

10-150	SIZE 4, Rubber cover, butyl bladder, nylon wound, Voit CS66 or Approved Equal	150	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-151	SIZE 5, Rubber, butyl bladder, nylon wound, Voit CS33 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
TETHER BALL									
10-175	Rubber, two ply butyl bladder, with reinforced rope attachment, and includes nylon braided rope, Voit VCT850HX or Approved Equal	30	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
VOLLEYBALL									
10-181	Volley Starter, Synthetic Leather, Official Size, Volley Starter, Official Size and weight (approx. 5.5 oz.), Yellow Color, Mikasa or approved equal	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-184	Volley Starter, Official Size and weight (approx. 5.5 oz.), Yellow Color, Mikasa Starterone Training Series VT1 or Approved Equal	20	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-185	Volley Starter, Oversized #2 size and weight (approx 7 oz.) Yellow color, Mikasa Starter Two Training Series VT2 or Approved Equal	15	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
FOAM BALLS W/FIRM EXTERIOR COVER									
10-190	Footballs, 9 3/4" Long, , Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	150	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-191	Soccer Balls, 7.5" Diameter Min., Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-192	Volleyballs, 7.5" Diameter Min., Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	30	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
PLAYGROUND BALLS, RUBBER									
<i>Bid all or none in this category</i>									
First quality, with replaceable valves, voit heavy duty or Approved Equal									
10-200	5", Red	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-201	6", Red	50	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-202	7", Red	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-203	8 1/2", Red	50	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-204	8 1/2", Green	150	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-205	8 1/2", Blue	50	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-206	8 1/2", Yellow	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-207	10", Red	40	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-208	13", Red	30	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-209	16" Red	15	Ea						
JUMP ROPES									
<i>Bid all or none in this category</i>									
10-243	9 Ft (length), 5/16" (diameter) heavy weight woven cotton cord, wooden spring loaded handles, CSI 9534 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-245	7 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95013 or Approved Equal	50	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-246	8 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95014 or Approved Equal	60	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-247	16 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95014 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

Merchants Paper Co.

BADMINTON ITEMS

10-255	Rackets, Steel Shaft, Nylon String, Top Quality Sportcraft Hardshot or Approved Equal	50	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-
10-258	Shuttle Cock, Medium Speed, Nylon, PVC Base, 6 ea/tube, CSI 0205 or Approved Equal	20	Tube	\$	-	Tube	\$	-

BASKETBALL NET

10-266	Net, Basketball, Nylon, Game Quality	20	Pair	\$	-	Pair	\$	-
10-267	Net, Basketball, Nylon, Anti-Whip	30	Pair	\$	-	Pair	\$	-

ATHLETIC WHISTLES

10-270	Metal Whistle, Nickel Plated, Metal Lanyard Ring, 12/Box, CSI 13083 or Approved Equal	30	Doz	\$	-	Doz	\$	-
10-272	Lanyard, 100% Nylon w/Clamp and Swivel Black, 12/Box, CSI 1346 or approved equal	0	Doz	\$	-	Doz	\$	-

MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES

10-280	Mesh Ball Bags, Nylon, 36", ¼" Mesh w/ Tie Cord at Top	30	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-
10-310	Wrestling Mat Tape, 3"X36", Vinyl Reuseable	275	Roll	\$	-	Ea	\$	-
10-402	Field Lining Paint, White, Latex, 5-Gal	70	Pail	\$	-	Ea	\$	-

TRAINER SUPPLIES

10-301	Tape, Athletic 1.5" x 15 yds, heavy Weight 32 rolls/case	0	Cs	\$	-	Cs	\$	-
10-305	Tape Underwrap, Polyurethane Foam, 2 ¾ x 30 yds, 48 Rolls/Case Cramer 214592 or Approved Equal	0	Cs	\$	-	Cs	\$	-
10-367	Wipes, 6" x 6.75" (Surface Only) 160/Tub, EPA Registered Anti-Viral, Sani-Cloth HB Q551722 or Approved Equal	300	Tub	\$	41.10	Tub	\$ 12,330.00	PDI Professional / Nice-Pak Must buy in case quantities 6/Cs

Pricing Firm Until: 7/31/2014
Delivery Date: 2 weeks
Terms: Net 15

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

Cannon Sports, Inc. Bid #62985
% for Non-Resident, California - NA

ESD Item No.	Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
Please Note Special Terms and Conditions below specification for the following items specified in this category								
BASKETBALLS--REGULATION, <u>Composite.</u>								
11-002	Wilson Evolution, SKU WTB0586R, Girls' Official size and weight 28.5", microfiber composite leather cover, Pebbled composite channels, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	7	Ea	\$ 39.00	Ea	\$ 273.00		AS
11-001	Wilson Evolution, SKU WTB0516R, Boys' Official size and weight 29.5", microfiber composite leather cover, Pebbled composite channels, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	8	Ea	\$ 39.00	Ea	\$ 312.00		AS
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA) specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/basketball/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
TENNIS BALLS—COMPETITION								
10-040	Wilson US Open-Extra Duty Felt, Optic Yellow, SKU WRT1071, Made with premium tex/tech industries felt, 3 balls/tube, USTA and ITF approved for competitive play	100	Tube	\$ 89.68	Cs/24Tubes	\$ 373.67		AS
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA), specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/tennis/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
VOLLEYBALLS—COMPETITION								
10-058	Wilson i-COR, SKU WTH7720XWHI, indoor use, Composite leather, Official size and weight, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	12	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA), specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/volleyball/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
BASKETBALLS								
10-110	Rubber, Junior size and weight, 27.5", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit Enduro CB6 or Approved Equal	150	Ea	\$ 2.83	Ea	\$ 424.50	CSI	ES
10-111	Rubber, Intermediate size and weight, 28.5-29", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit CB8 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$ 3.31	Ea	\$ 331.00	CSI	ES
10-112	Rubber, Official Size and weight, 29.5", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit CB2 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
FOOTBALLS & FOOTBALL ITEMS								
10-120	Junior (6) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F100 or Approved Equal	30	Ea	\$ 3.15	Ea	\$ 94.50	CSI	ES
10-121	Intermediate (8) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F200 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
10-122	Official (9) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F300 or Approved Equal	80	Ea	\$ 3.62	Ea	\$ 289.60	CSI	ES
SOCCER BALLS								

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

Cannon Sports, Inc. Bid #62985

10-150	SIZE 4, Rubber cover, butyl bladder, nylon wound, Voit CS66 or Approved Equal	150	Ea	\$	2.88	Ea	\$	432.00	CSI	ES
10-151	SIZE 5, Rubber, butyl bladder, nylon wound, Voit CS33 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$	3.10	Ea	\$	310.00	CSI	ES
TETHER BALL										
10-175	Rubber, two ply butyl bladder, with reinforced rope attachment, and includes nylon braided rope, Voit VCT850HX or Approved Equal	30	Ea	\$	5.05	Ea	\$	151.50	Westernstar	ES
VOLLEYBALL										
10-181	Volley Starter, Synthetic Leather, Official Size, Volley Starter, Official Size and weight (approx. 5.5 oz.), Yellow Color, Mikasa or approved equal	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-		
10-184	Volley Starter, Official Size and weight (approx. 5.5 oz.), Yellow Color, Mikasa Starterone Training Series VT1 or Approved Equal	20	Ea	\$	13.05	Ea	\$	261.00	Mikasa	AS
10-185	Volley Starter, Oversized #2 size and weight (approx 7 oz.) Yellow color, Mikasa Starter Two Training Series VT2 or Approved Equal	15	Ea	\$	14.30	Ea	\$	214.50	Mikasa	AS
FOAM BALLS W/FIRM EXTERIOR COVER										
Bid all or none in this category										
10-190	Footballs, 9 3/4" Long, , Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	150	Ea	\$	4.28	Ea	\$	642.00	CSI	ES
10-191	Soccer Balls, 7.5" Diameter Min., Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$	5.71	Ea	\$	571.00	CSI	ES
10-192	Volleyballs, 7.5" Diameter Min., Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	30	Ea	\$	5.10	Ea	\$	153.00	CSI	ES
PLAYGROUND BALLS, RUBBER										
Bid all or none in this category										
First quality, with replaceable valves, voit heavy duty or Approved Equal										
10-200	5", Red	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-		
10-201	6", Red	50	Ea	\$	1.82	Ea	\$	91.00	CSI	ES
10-202	7", Red	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-		
10-203	8 1/2", Red	50	Ea	\$	2.83	Ea	\$	141.50	CSI	ES
10-204	8 1/2", Green	150	Ea	\$	3.92	Ea	\$	588.00	CSI	ES
10-205	8 1/2", Blue	50	Ea	\$	3.92	Ea	\$	196.00	CSI	ES
10-206	8 1/2", Yellow	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-		
10-207	10", Red	40	Ea	\$	3.25	Ea	\$	130.00	CSI	ES
10-208	13", Red	30	Ea	\$	6.95	Ea	\$	208.50	CSI	ES
10-209	16" Red	15	Ea	\$	2.55	Ea	\$	38.25	CSI	ES
JUMP ROPES										
Bid all or none in this category										
10-243	9 Ft (length), 5/16" (diameter) heavy weight woven cotton cord, wooden spring loaded handles, CSI 9534 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-		
10-245	7 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95013 or Approved Equal	50	Ea	\$	0.76	Ea	\$	38.00	CSI	AS
10-246	8 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95014 or Approved Equal	60	Ea	\$	1.16	Ea	\$	69.60	CSI	AS
10-247	16 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95014 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$	1.53	Ea	\$	153.00	CSI	AS

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

Cannon Sports, Inc. Bid #62985

BADMINTON ITEMS

10-255	Rackets, Steel Shaft, Nylon String, Top Quality Sportcraft Hardshot or Approved Equal	50	Ea	\$	1.98	Ea	\$	99.00	CSI	ES
10-258	Shuttle Cock, Medium Speed, Nylon, PVC Base, 6 ea/tube, CSI 0205 or Approved Equal	20	Tube	\$	6.61	Tube	\$	132.20	CSI	AS

BASKETBALL NET

10-266	Net, Basketball, Nylon, Game Quality	20	Pair	\$	0.97	Pair	\$	19.40	Not supplied	AS
10-267	Net, Basketball, Nylon, Anti-Whip	30	Pair	\$	1.46	Pair	\$	43.80	Not supplied	AS

ATHLETIC WHISTLES

10-270	Metal Whistle, Nickel Plated, Metal Lanyard Ring, 12/Box, CSI 13083 or Approved Equal	30	Doz	\$	0.81	Doz	\$	24.30	CSI	AS/mistakenly provided each pricing rather than by the dozen, awarded to next lowest bidder
10-272	Lanyard, 100% Nylon w/Clamp and Swivel Black, 12/Box, CSI 1346 or approved equal	0	Doz	\$	-	Doz	\$	-		

MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES

10-280	Mesh Ball Bags, Nylon, 36", ¼" Mesh w/ Tie Cord at Top	30	Ea	\$	3.45	Ea	\$	103.50	Not supplied	AS
10-310	Wrestling Mat Tape, 3"X36", Vinyl Reuseable	275	Roll	\$	3.63	Ea	\$	998.25	Not supplied	AS
10-402	Field Lining Paint, White, Latex, 5-Gal	70	Pail	\$	-	Ea	\$	-		

TRAINER SUPPLIES

10-301	Tape, Athletic 1.5" x 15 yds, heavy Weight 32 rolls/case	0	Cs	\$	-	Cs	\$	-		
10-305	Tape Underwrap, Polyurethane Foam, 2 ¾ x 30 yds, 48 Rolls/Case Cramer 214592 or Approved Equal	0	Cs	\$	-	Cs	\$	-		
10-367	Wipes, 6" x 6.75" (Surface Only) 160/Tub, EPA Registered Anti-Viral, Sani-Cloth HB Q551722 or Approved Equal	300	Tub	\$	-	Tub	\$	-		

Pricing Firm Until: 2014-2015
Delivery Date: 5-45 days or less/ARO
Terms: Terms: 0% Net 30 Days

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

AFP Industries, Inc.

% for Non-resident Florida, none

ESD Item No.	Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
BASKETBALLS--REGULATION, <u>Composite.</u>								
11-002	Wilson Evolution, SKU WTB0586R, Girls' Official size and weight 28.5", microfiber composite leather cover, Pebbled composite channels, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	7	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
11-001	Wilson Evolution, SKU WTB0516R, Boys' Official size and weight 29.5", microfiber composite leather cover, Pebbled composite channels, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	8	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA) specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/basketball/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
TENNIS BALLS—COMPETITION								
10-040	Wilson US Open-Extra Duty Felt, Optic Yellow, SKU WRT1071, Made with premium tex/tech industries felt, 3 balls/tube, USTA and ITF approved for competitive play	100	Tube	\$ -	Tube	\$ -		
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA), specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/tennis/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
VOLLEYBALLS—COMPETITION								
10-058	Wilson i-COR, SKU WTH7720XWHI, indoor use, Composite leather, Official size and weight, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	12	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA), specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/volleyball/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
BASKETBALLS								
10-110	Rubber, Junior size and weight, 27.5", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit Enduro CB6 or Approved Equal	150	Ea	\$ 6.49	Ea	\$ 973.50	360 Athletics	Order x of 36
10-111	Rubber, Intermediate size and weight, 28.5-29", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit CB8 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$ 6.49	Ea	\$ 649.00	360 Athletics	Order x of 36
10-112	Rubber, Official Size and weight, 29.5", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit CB2 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$ 6.99	Ea	\$ -	360 Athletics	Order x of 36
FOOTBALLS & FOOTBALL ITEMS								
10-120	Junior (6) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F100 or Approved Equal	30	Ea	\$ 7.95	Ea	\$ 238.50	360 Athletics	
10-121	Intermediate (8) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F200 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$ 8.21	Ea	\$ -	360 Athletics	
10-122	Official (9) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F300 or Approved Equal	80	Ea	\$ 8.49	Ea	\$ 679.20	360 Athletics	Order x of 50
SOCCER BALLS								

Please Note Special Terms and Conditions below specification for the following items specified in this category

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

AFP Industries, Inc.

10-150	SIZE 4, Rubber cover, butyl bladder, nylon wound, Voit CS66 or Approved Equal	150	Ea	\$	7.89	Ea	\$ 1,183.50	360 Athletics	Order x of 50
10-151	SIZE 5, Rubber, butyl bladder, nylon wound, Voit CS33 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$	7.97	Ea	\$ 797.00	360 Athletics	Order x of 50
TETHER BALL									
10-175	Rubber, two ply butyl bladder, with reinforced rope attachment, and includes nylon braided rope, Voit VCT850HX or Approved Equal	30	Ea	\$	15.67	Ea	\$ 470.10	360 Athletics	
VOLLEYBALL									
10-181	Volley Starter, Synthetic Leather, Official Size, Volley Starter, Official Size and weight (approx. 5.5 oz.), Yellow Color, Mikasa or approved equal	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$ -		
10-184	Volley Starter, Official Size and weight (approx. 5.5 oz.), Yellow Color, Mikasa Starterone Training Series VT1 or Approved Equal	20	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$ -		
10-185	Volley Starter, Oversized #2 size and weight (approx 7 oz.) Yellow color, Mikasa Starter Two Training Series VT2 or Approved Equal	15	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$ -		
FOAM BALLS W/FIRM EXTERIOR COVER									
10-190	Footballs, 9 3/4" Long, , Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	150	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$ -		Bid all or none in this category
10-191	Soccer Balls, 7.5" Diameter Min., Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$ -		
10-192	Volleyballs, 7.5" Diameter Min., Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	30	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$ -		
PLAYGROUND BALLS, RUBBER									
First quality, with replaceable valves, voit heavy duty or Approved Equal									
10-200	5", Red	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$ -		
10-201	6", Red	50	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$ -		
10-202	7", Red	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$ -		
10-203	8 1/2", Red	50	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$ -		
10-204	8 1/2", Green	150	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$ -		
10-205	8 1/2", Blue	50	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$ -		
10-206	8 1/2", Yellow	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$ -		
10-207	10", Red	40	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$ -		
10-208	13", Red	30	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$ -		
10-209	16" Red	15	Ea						
JUMP ROPES									
Bid all or none in this category									
10-243	9 Ft (length), 5/16" (diameter) heavy weight woven cotton cord, wooden spring loaded handles, CSI 9534 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$	3.77	Ea	\$ -	360 Athletics	
10-245	7 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95013 or Approved Equal	50	Ea	\$	2.55	Ea	\$ 127.50	360 Athletics	
10-246	8 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95014 or Approved Equal	60	Ea	\$	2.65	Ea	\$ 159.00	360 Athletics	
10-247	16 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95014 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$	3.47	Ea	\$ 347.00	360 Athletics	Order x of 50

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

AFP Industries, Inc.

BADMINTON ITEMS

10-255	Rackets, Steel Shaft, Nylon String, Top Quality Sportcraft Hardshot or Approved Equal	50	Ea	\$	4.27	Ea	\$	213.50	360 Athletics	Order x of 50
10-258	Shuttle Cock, Medium Speed, Nylon, PVC Base, 6 ea/tube, CSI 0205 or Approved Equal	20	Tube	\$	-	Tube	\$	-		

BASKETBALL NET

10-266	Net, Basketball, Nylon, Game Quality	20	Pair	\$	5.25	Pair	\$	105.00	360 Athletics
10-267	Net, Basketball, Nylon, Anti-Whip	30	Pair	\$	13.47	Pair	\$	404.10	360 Athletics

ATHLETIC WHISTLES

10-270	Metal Whistle, Nickel Plated, Metal Lanyard Ring, 12/Box, CSI 13083 or Approved Equal	30	Doz	\$	23.47	Doz	\$	704.10	360 Athletics
10-272	Lanyard, 100% Nylon w/Clamp and Swivel Black, 12/Box, CSI 1346 or approved equal	0	Doz	\$	-	Doz	\$	-	

MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES

10-280	Mesh Ball Bags, Nylon, 36", ¼" Mesh w/ Tie Cord at Top	30	Ea	\$	5.25	Ea	\$	157.50	360 Athletics
10-310	Wrestling Mat Tape, 3"X36", Vinyl Reuseable	275	Roll	\$	11.87	Ea	\$	3,264.25	360 Athletics
10-402	Field Lining Paint, White, Latex, 5-Gal	70	Pail	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	

TRAINER SUPPLIES

10-301	Tape, Athletic 1.5" x 15 yds, heavy Weight 32 rolls/case	0	Cs	\$	-	Cs	\$	-	
10-305	Tape Underwrap, Polyurethane Foam, 2 ¾ x 30 yds, 48 Rolls/Case Cramer 214592 or Approved Equal	0	Cs	\$	-	Cs	\$	-	
10-367	Wipes, 6" x 6.75" (Surface Only) 160/Tub, EPA Registered Anti-Viral, Sani-Cloth HB Q551722 or Approved Equal	300	Tub	\$	-	Tub	\$	-	

Pricing Firm Until: 12/31/2014
Delivery Date: As specified or 14 days after PO
Terms: Net 30

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

Henry Schien

% for Non-Resident, Oregon - NA

ESD Item No.	Description / Specifications	Est.	UOM	Price	UOM	Total	Brand Name	Notes
BASKETBALLS--REGULATION, <u>Composite.</u>								
11-002	Wilson Evolution, SKU WTB0586R, Girls' Official size and weight 28.5", microfiber composite leather cover, Pebbled composite channels, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	7	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		Please Note Special Terms and Conditions below specification for the following items specified in this category
11-001	Wilson Evolution, SKU WTB0516R, Boys' Official size and weight 29.5", microfiber composite leather cover, Pebbled composite channels, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	8	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA) specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/basketball/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
TENNIS BALLS—COMPETITION								
10-040	Wilson US Open-Extra Duty Felt, Optic Yellow, SKU WRT1071, Made with premium tex/tech industries felt, 3 balls/tube, USTA and ITF approved for competitive play	100	Tube	\$ -	Tube	\$ -		
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA), specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/tennis/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
VOLLEYBALLS—COMPETITION								
10-058	Wilson i-COR, SKU WTH7720XWHI, indoor use, Composite leather, Official size and weight, with (National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS) Stamp	12	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
In accordance with Oregon School Activities Association (OSAA), specified brand is required for regulation play thus no other brand name or variety will be accepted. Reference: http://www.osaa.org/volleyball/ click link for "Administrators/Coaches"								
BASKETBALLS								
10-110	Rubber, Junior size and weight, 27.5", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit Enduro CB6 or Approved Equal	150	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
10-111	Rubber, Intermediate size and weight, 28.5-29", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit CB8 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
10-112	Rubber, Official Size and weight, 29.5", nylon wound, no raised letters, indoor/outdoor use, Voit CB2 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
FOOTBALLS & FOOTBALL ITEMS								
10-120	Junior (6) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F100 or Approved Equal	30	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
10-121	Intermediate (8) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F200 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
10-122	Official (9) size and weight, molded rubber cover, molded rubber laces, nylon wound bladder, Baden F300 or Approved Equal	80	Ea	\$ -	Ea	\$ -		
SOCCER BALLS								

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

Henry Schien

10-150	SIZE 4, Rubber cover, butyl bladder, nylon wound, Voit CS66 or Approved Equal	150	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-151	SIZE 5, Rubber, butyl bladder, nylon wound, Voit CS33 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
TETHER BALL									
10-175	Rubber, two ply butyl bladder, with reinforced rope attachment, and includes nylon braided rope, Voit VCT850HX or Approved Equal	30	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
VOLLEYBALL									
10-181	Volley Starter, Synthetic Leather, Official Size, Volley Starter, Official Size and weight (approx. 5.5 oz.), Yellow Color, Mikasa or approved equal	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-184	Volley Starter, Official Size and weight (approx. 5.5 oz.), Yellow Color, Mikasa Starterone Training Series VT1 or Approved Equal	20	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-185	Volley Starter, Oversized #2 size and weight (approx 7 oz.) Yellow color, Mikasa Starter Two Training Series VT2 or Approved Equal	15	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
FOAM BALLS W/FIRM EXTERIOR COVER									
10-190	Footballs, 9 3/4" Long, , Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	150	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-191	Soccer Balls, 7.5" Diameter Min., Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-192	Volleyballs, 7.5" Diameter Min., Foam, Nerf Type or Approved Equal	30	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
PLAYGROUND BALLS, RUBBER									
First quality, with replaceable valves, voit heavy duty or Approved Equal									
10-200	5", Red	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-201	6", Red	50	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-202	7", Red	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-203	8 1/2", Red	50	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-204	8 1/2", Green	150	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-205	8 1/2", Blue	50	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-206	8 1/2", Yellow	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-207	10", Red	40	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-208	13", Red	30	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-209	16" Red	15	Ea						
JUMP ROPES									
10-243	9 Ft (length), 5/16" (diameter) heavy weight woven cotton cord, wooden spring loaded handles, CSI 9534 or Approved Equal	0	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-245	7 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95013 or Approved Equal	50	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-246	8 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95014 or Approved Equal	60	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	
10-247	16 Ft., Olympic Style, Braided Nylon, Protected With Break Resistant Plastic Link Sections and Handles, CSI 95014 or Approved Equal	100	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-	

Bid all or none in this category

Bid all or none in this category

Bid all or none in this category

Recap InterMountain ESD IFB# 015-Athletic-001 Due: 06/05/14 at 1:00pm

Award Highlighted in Light Blue

Henry Schien

BADMINTON ITEMS

10-255	Rackets, Steel Shaft, Nylon String, Top Quality Sportcraft Hardshot or Approved Equal	50	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-
10-258	Shuttle Cock, Medium Speed, Nylon, PVC Base, 6 ea/tube, CSI 0205 or Approved Equal	20	Tube	\$	-	Tube	\$	-

BASKETBALL NET

10-266	Net, Basketball, Nylon, Game Quality	20	Pair	\$	-	Pair	\$	-
10-267	Net, Basketball, Nylon, Anti-Whip	30	Pair	\$	-	Pair	\$	-

ATHLETIC WHISTLES

10-270	Metal Whistle, Nickel Plated, Metal Lanyard Ring, 12/Box, CSI 13083 or Approved Equal	30	Doz	\$	-	Doz	\$	-
10-272	Lanyard, 100% Nylon w/Clamp and Swivel Black, 12/Box, CSI 1346 or approved equal	0	Doz	\$	-	Doz	\$	-

MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES

10-280	Mesh Ball Bags, Nylon, 36", ¼" Mesh w/ Tie Cord at Top	30	Ea	\$	-	Ea	\$	-
10-310	Wrestling Mat Tape, 3"X36", Vinyl Reuseable	275	Roll	\$	-	Ea	\$	-
10-402	Field Lining Paint, White, Latex, 5-Gal	70	Pail	\$	-	Ea	\$	-

TRAINER SUPPLIES

10-301	Tape, Athletic 1.5" x 15 yds, heavy Weight 32 rolls/case	0	Cs	\$	34.33	Cs	\$	-	Pro Formula
10-305	Tape Underwrap, Polyurethane Foam, 2 ¾ x 30 yds, 48 Rolls/Case Cramer 214592 or Approved Equal	0	Cs	\$	32.15	Cs	\$	-	Cramer
10-367	Wipes, 6" x 6.75" (Surface Only) 160/Tub, EPA Registered Anti-Viral, Sani-Cloth HB Q551722 or Approved Equal	300	Tub	\$	5.35	Tub	\$	-	Super Size Cloth

Pricing Firm Until: 6/1/2015
Delivery Date: 3 to 5 days for stocked items
Terms: Net 30 Days